
 

 

Copyright © 2015 by ENGEO 
Incorporated. This document may not be 
reproduced in whole or in part by any 
means whatsoever, nor may it be quoted 
or excerpted without the express written 
consent of ENGEO Incorporated 

MORAGA 
GEOLOGIC HAZARD 

ABATEMENT DISTRICT (GHAD) 
PLAN OF CONTROL 

RANCHO LAGUNA DEVELOPMENT 
MORAGA, CALIFORNIA 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

Submitted to: 
SummerHill Homes 

777 S. California Avenue 
Palo Alto, California 

 
Prepared by: 

ENGEO Incorporated 
 

Project No. 
 2655.001.000 

 
May 20, 2015 

Revised March 1, 2017



GEOTECHNICAL 

ENVIRONMENTAL 

WATER RESOURCES 

CONSTRUCTION SERVICES 

 

 
2010 Crow Canyon Place, Suite 250  San Ramon, CA 94583  (925) 866-9000  Fax (888) 279-2698 

www.engeo.com 

 

 

 

Project No. 

2655.001.000 

 

May 20, 2015 

Revised March 1, 2017 

 

Mr. Kevin Ebrahimi 
SummerHill Homes 

777 S. California Avenue 

Palo Alto, CA  94304 

 

Subject: Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330 

 Moraga, California 

 

PLAN OF CONTROL 

 

Dear Mr. Ebrahimi: 

 

Attached is the proposed Plan of Control for the Rancho Laguna development 

(Subdivision 9330) within the Moraga Geologic Hazard Abatement District (GHAD). The Plan 

of Control satisfies portions of Condition of Approval No. 91 – GHAD Formation and additional 

conditions related to the GHAD. 

 

If you have any questions or would like any additional information, please do not hesitate to 

contact us. 

 

Sincerely, 

 

ENGEO Incorporated 

 

 

 

 

Eric Harrell, CEG     Paul C. Guerin, GE 

eh/pcg/cjn:poc 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 
 

Letter of Transmittal  

1.0 INTRODUCTION ........................................................................................... 1 

1.1 PROPERTY IDENTIFICATION, OWNERSHIP AND MAINTENANCE 

RESPONSIBILITIES .................................................................................................1 

2.0 RANCHO LAGUNA PLAN OF CONTROL ................................................ 1 

2.1 GEOLOGIC HAZARDS............................................................................................1 
2.1.1 Slope Instability – Rancho Laguna ....................................................................1 

2.1.2 Creek Bank Instability .......................................................................................4 

2.1.3 Seismically Induced Ground Shaking and Landsliding .....................................4 

2.1.4 Swell/Settlement Related to Deep Fills .............................................................4 

2.1.5 Compressible Soils.............................................................................................4 

2.1.6 Expansive Soils ..................................................................................................5 

2.2 SLOPE STABILITY CONSIDERATIONS DURING MASS GRADING ...........5 

2.3 GHAD-MAINTAINED IMPROVEMENTS AND OPEN SPACE AREAS .........5 
2.3.1 Agency Notice ...................................................................................................7 

2.3.2 General Landslide Mitigation ............................................................................7 

2.4 BIOTECHNICAL RECOMMENDATIONS FOR PREVENTION 

AND MITIGATION OF EXISTING OR POTENTIAL EROSION 

HAZARDS ...................................................................................................................8 

2.5 CRITERIA FOR GHAD RESPONSIBILITY .........................................................8 
2.5.1 Isolated or Remote Slope Instability ..................................................................8 

2.5.2 Single Property...................................................................................................9 

2.5.3 Geologic Hazards Resulting From Negligence of Property Owner ...................9 

2.5.4 Property Not Accepted .......................................................................................9 

2.5.5 Geologic Hazard Which Requires Expenditure in Amount Exceeding the 

Value of the Threatened or Damaged Improvement ..........................................9 

2.5.6 GHAD Funding or Reimbursement for Damaged or Destroyed Structures 

or Site Improvements .........................................................................................9 

2.5.7 No Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Property Owners ......................10 

2.6 PRIORITY FOR DISTRICT-FUNDED REPAIRS ..............................................10 

2.7 MAINTENANCE AND MONITORING SCHEDULE ........................................11 

3.0 GLOSSARY .................................................................................................... 12 

4.0 OWNERSHIP AND MANAGEMENT ........................................................ 13 

5.0 RIGHT-OF-ENTRY ...................................................................................... 15 

LIST OF REFERENCES 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

TABLE OF CONTENTS (Continued) 
 

 

FIGURES 

EXHIBIT A – Legal Description for Subdivision 9330 

EXHIBIT B – Plat to Accompany Legal Description for Subdivision 9330, Boundary Exhibit 

EXHIBIT C – Rancho Laguna - Authority and Proposed Development 

EXHIBIT D – Rancho Laguna - Geology 

EXHIBIT E – Rancho Laguna - Funding and Acceptance 

EXHIBIT F – Rancho Laguna - Disclosure and Right-of-Entry 

EXHIBIT G – Rancho Laguna - Wetland Mitigation Program 

EXHIBIT H – Rancho Laguna - Open Space Management Plan 

EXHIBIT I – Rancho Laguna - Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan 

EXHIBIT J – Rancho Laguna - Public Trail System Plan 

EXHIBIT K – Rancho Laguna - Selected GHAD-Related Conditions of Approval 

EXHIBIT L – Rancho Laguna - Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 1 - 

1.0 INTRODUCTION 
 

Under the Conditions of Approval, Condition No. 91 for the Rancho Laguna development 

(Subdivision 9330), the Town of Moraga has required that the Rancho Laguna development be 

included within a GHAD either by formation or annexation prior to filing of the first final map 

for the project. To satisfy this requirement, the developer of the Rancho Laguna Development 

has prepared this Plan of Control to support inclusion of the Rancho Laguna development into 

the existing Moraga GHAD (“GHAD” or “District”). 

 

1.1 PROPERTY IDENTIFICATION, OWNERSHIP AND MAINTENANCE 

RESPONSIBILITIES 

 

A written description of parcels within the Rancho Laguna development in the existing Moraga 

GHAD is provided in Exhibit A and shown graphically on Exhibit B. The GHAD area includes 

Assessor’s Parcel Number (APN) 256-040-024-0. Ownership and maintenance responsibilities 

for the individual parcels within the Rancho Laguna development (Subdivision 9330) are shown 

on Figures 1A, 1B, and 1C. 

 

2.0 RANCHO LAGUNA PLAN OF CONTROL 
 

2.1 GEOLOGIC HAZARDS 

 

Geologic hazards identified for the site in the ENGEO Geotechnical Exploration report 

(Reference 1) dated May 30, 2013, or corrective grading plan (Figure 2), include the following 

items. 

 

 Slope instability 

 Creek bank instability 

 Seismically induced ground shaking/landsliding 

 Swell/settlement related to deep fills 

 Compressible soils 

 Expansive soils 

 

These geologic hazards are not expected to be eliminated entirely by site grading. Slope 

instability or potential slope instability is not unique to this project but is of importance for 

hillside projects throughout the San Francisco Bay Area, including Moraga. Future stability 

depends on various factors, including any introduction of natural or artificial groundwater, future 

grading and earthquake ground shaking. 

 

2.1.1 Slope Instability – Rancho Laguna 

 

During mapping for the Rancho Laguna geotechnical exploration, areas of slope instability were 

identified throughout the planned development area and within the future open space areas. The 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 2 - 

corrective grading plan showing the location of each of the mapped landslides is included as 

Figure 2. The table below identifies each of the labeled landslide areas within the development 

area and the proposed corrective measures. In addition to the labeled landslides, a number of 

other landslides are shown on Figure 2 outside of the development area where, due to their 

location, mitigation measures have not been proposed during mass grading activities. Potential 

District monitoring or maintenance activities for the specific areas listed in the table below are 

discussed in Section 2.3.2. 

 

TABLE 2.1.1-1 

Mapped Landslides and Proposed Corrective Measures  

Landslide 

Designation 

Affected Lots  

and Area 

Type  

of Feature 

Estimated 

Depth (feet) 
Mitigation Method 

A Rheem Boulevard Deep soil slide 25 

Outside proposed 

development/GHAD – no 

mitigation planned 

B 
Fill slope and  

Rheem Boulevard 
Deep soil slide 25 

Remove and replace 

downslope portion of slide  

C Rheem Boulevard Deep soil slide 30 to 35 
Remove and replace 

downslope portion of slide  

D Rheem Boulevard Slump/earth flow 15 

Outside proposed 

development/GHAD – no 

mitigation planned 

E Rheem Boulevard Deep soil slide 25 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

1 Lots 26 and 27 Slump 15 Remove and replace 

2 
Lots 3 and 4; 

roadway 
Slump 10 

Partial removal at toe within 

grading limits with subdrain 

placement in open space 

portion 

3 
Lots 5, 6, 11, and 

roadway 
Slump 20 

Partial removal at toe within 

grading limits 

4 None Slump 10 

Outside proposed 

development area– no 

mitigation planned 

5 
Lot 11, fill slope and 

roadway 
Slump/earth flow 10 

Partial removal at toe within 

grading limits 

6 Creek Slump 15 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

7 Creek Slump 10 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 3 - 

Landslide 

Designation 

Affected Lots  

and Area 

Type  

of Feature 

Estimated 

Depth (feet) 
Mitigation Method 

8 Creek 
Slump/ deep-

seated complex 
30 

Outside proposed 

development area– no 

mitigation planned 

9 Creek Slump 15 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

10 None Slump 10 

 Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

11 None Slump 10 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

12 Fill slope Slump 15 
Partial removal at toe within 

grading limits 

13 

Lots 16, 17, 18, 19, 

and 20; Fill slope and 

“C” Court 

Slump 15 
Remove and replace within 

grading limits 

14 None Slump 10 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

15 None Slump 10 

Outside proposed 

development area – no 

mitigation planned 

16 None Slump 10 
Outside proposed 

development area – no 
mitigation planned 

17 
Lots 18, 19, and 20 

backyards 
Slump 15 

Outside proposed 
development area 

improvements – no mitigation 
planned 

18 
Lots 8 and 9; 24 and 

25 backyards 
Slump/ earth 

flow 
10 

Partial removal of upslope 
portion affected by grading 

limits 

19 Detention pond 
Slump/ earth 

flow 
10 

Partial removal of upslope 
portion affected by grading 

limits 

 

A landslide is defined as a mass of rock, soil and other debris that has been displaced downslope 

by sliding, flowing or falling. Landslides include cohesive block glides and disrupted slumps that 

have formed by displacement along a planar slip surface or rotation (displacement along a curved 

slip surface). Undercutting and erosion of hillside slopes can trigger slope failures. 

 

Slope failures are also triggered by increased pore water pressure due to the infiltration of 

rainwater. The resulting decrease of shear resistance (internal resistance to deformation by 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 4 - 

shearing) can cause a slope to move. The level of the groundwater table varies with the amount 

of rainfall for the area. If rainfall is higher than average during the winter season, the water table 

may be higher than average on a hillslope and groundwater pressures may become high. Under 

these conditions, hillside movement can be activated. 

 

Areas of thickened soil cover on the hillslopes are known as colluvium (Qc). Colluvial deposits 

are typically the result of soil creep and may be in a weak, unconsolidated state, making them 

susceptible to landsliding if undercut. Colluvial deposits located within open-space areas are 

natural landforms that do not require mitigation, except where they affect manmade 

improvements. Potential mitigation and repair measures for District areas near improvements are 

discussed in Section 3. 

 

2.1.2 Creek Bank Instability 

 

As identified in the Corrective Grading Plan, creek banks along Rheem Creek are subject to 

erosion and localized slumping. The banks appear to have been oversteepened by erosion and 

consist of relatively weak materials. As mapped, most of the creek bank is composed of landslide 

material.  

 

2.1.3 Seismically Induced Ground Shaking and Landsliding 

 

As identified in the Geotechnical Exploration report, an earthquake of moderate to high 

magnitude generated within the San Francisco Bay Region could cause considerable ground 

shaking at the site, similar to that which has occurred in the past. Seismic slope stability has been 

considered in the geotechnical reports completed for the site; however, seismically generated 

slope failures could occur outside the grading limits within the Rancho Laguna Development. 

 

2.1.4 Swell/Settlement Related to Deep Fills 

 

According to the preliminary grading plans, fills up to about 50 feet thick will be placed in the 

swale areas. Studies have shown that engineered fills in residential development sites typically 

experience increases in moisture content after building construction due to increases in irrigation 

or natural conditions and to alteration of drainage patterns. This process may take about 10 to 

15 years after irrigation commences, or even more, before the fill becomes fully wetted. The 

wetting process can cause settlement or swell (hydrocompression due to wetting) depending on 

soil type, compaction, moisture content, and the overburden pressures (fill thickness). 

 

2.1.5 Compressible Soils 

 

As identified in the Geotechnical Exploration report, settlement of soft soils may be significant if 

not properly mitigated. Differential movement under structures is a primary geotechnical 

concern. Settlement at the site could be generated from: (1) consolidation of the alluvial and 

colluvial deposits in the swale areas where fills will be placed, (2) compression of the deep fills 

due to their own weight, and (3) compression of soils beneath foundation systems due to building 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 5 - 

loads. As recommended, with the exception of the existing East Bay Municipal Utilities District 

(EBMUD) fill, compressible fill, landslide, alluvial, and colluvial soil materials will be removed 

within the area of development during corrective grading. 

 
As planned, the EBMUD fill area will be monitored to determine when the majority of 
settlement has occurred and home construction can begin. According to preliminary grading 
plan, fill up to about 40 feet will be planned at lots along Rheem Boulevard. Based on 
the analyses completed, the settlement due to additional fill load at lots adjacent to 
Rheem Boulevard will be about 3 to 6 inches. 
 

2.1.6 Expansive Soils 

 

Near-surface soils, in addition to the ash bed, claystone, and siltstone at the site, could exhibit a 

high potential for expansion. These potentially expansive soils could impact the planned site 

development. Expansive soils shrink and swell as a result of moisture change. This can cause 

heaving and cracking of slabs-on-grade, pavements and structures founded on shallow 

foundations. The potential for expansive soils has been identified in previous reports for the 

property. Shrink and swell of expansive soils on slopes is a portion of the mechanism of creep 

movement, which can result in shallow slope instability. 

 

2.2 SLOPE STABILITY CONSIDERATIONS DURING MASS GRADING 

 

As recommended in the Geotechnical Exploration report for the Rancho Laguna development, 

existing non-documented artificial fills within the graded area will be removed prior to 

engineered fill placement with the exception of the EBMUD fill. In addition, unsuitable 

materials, which could include colluvium and other unsuitable material, will be overexcavated to 

firm undisturbed materials below the unsuitable material as determined by the project 

Geotechnical Engineer or Engineering Geologist (ENGEO) at the time of grading. Subdrains will 

be installed to collect subsurface waters. The configuration of the subdrainage system will be 

tailored to the subsurface conditions at the time of grading. The planned location and elevation of 

subdrains and outlets are shown on the Geotechnical Corrective Grading Plan (Figure 2). Each 

subexcavation area will be reconstructed to final grade by keying and benching into stable 

materials with compacted, drained engineered fill (Figure 3).  

 

Cuts will be viewed by a geologist during grading to provide mitigation schemes for unsuspected 

slope conditions, which could decrease the slope stability. Such conditions include unfavorable 

bedrock attitudes and seepage conditions. Grading reports shall be made available to the GHAD 

for its use following completion of the project development. 

 

2.3 GHAD-MAINTAINED IMPROVEMENTS AND OPEN SPACE AREAS 

 

Conditions of Approval (COA) Numbers 29, 33, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 97, 105, 132, 237, 238, 239, 

242(e), and 244 address parcel ownership and GHAD maintenance responsibilities. Text of the 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 6 - 

listed Conditions of Approval is included in Exhibit K and, as appropriate, ownership and 

maintenance responsibilities are identified below. 

 

The District will have authority and responsibility to manage erosion and other geologic hazards 

within the boundary shown in Exhibit B subject to the exclusions listed in Section 2.5 – Criteria 

for GHAD Responsibility. The GHAD shall be responsible for monitoring and maintenance of 

the features listed below located within the GHAD-owned parcels (Parcels A, B, and D of the 

Vesting Tentative Map (VTM)) shown on the Open Space and Improvement 

Ownership/Maintenance Plan (Figure 1). 

 

 Slopes 

 Reconstructed and unaltered creek channels 

 Water quality/detention basin 

 Debris benches 

 Emergency vehicle access (EVA) and maintenance roads 

 Concrete-lined drainage ditches 

 Storm drain system improvements 

 Developer constructed retaining walls 

 Subdrains and subdrain outlets 

 Selected Wetland Mitigation Program (WMP) and Open Space Management Plan (OSMP) 

activities within the deed restricted parcels 

 

The GHAD intends to mitigate, prevent, abate or repair landslide or erosion hazards that could 

directly affect property within the GHAD boundary, as necessary to implement this Plan of 

Control. A Pacific Gas and Electric Company (PG&E) easement is located across a portion of 

Parcel A for towers and roadways (Figure 1). The easement allows PG&E the right to construct 

and maintain towers and roadways. In addition, two land lease agreements are located on 

Parcel A with AT&T and Verizon. The GHAD will not be responsible for construction, 

maintenance and/or replacement of the improvements allowed under these agreements. 

 

As a responsible landowner, the GHAD will also assume open-space management 

responsibilities for Parcels A, B, and D that are required for the Rancho Laguna project. These 

responsibilities will include: 

 

 Fuel management for fire suppression 

 Fencing 

 Gravel surfaced parking area and developed trails including kiosk 

 

Fuel management for fire suppression will be managed in accordance with the Wildfire Hazard 

Assessment and Plan (Exhibit I). Trail maintenance activities will be undertaken in accordance 

with the Public Trail System Plan (Exhibit J). 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 7 - 

2.3.1 Agency Notice 

 

Long-term management, monitoring, and maintenance of habitat features and values within 

Parcels A, B, and D (“Open Space Parcels”) will be the responsibility of the GHAD. The Open 

Space Parcels will be subject to a deed restriction for development (Exhibit L). It is anticipated 

that a third party Natural Lands Manager will have enforcement rights for the deed restriction. 

After the GHAD has accepted transfer of monitoring, maintenance, and ownership of the Open 

Space Parcels, funding of responsibilities will be provided through the GHAD assessment. All 

activities in GHAD-owned open space parcels shall be subject to approval of the GHAD. 

The GHAD will comply with the requirements of the Wetland Mitigation Program (WMP) and 

Open Space Management Plan (OSMP). In addition, the GHAD will comply with the 

requirements of the 401 Water Quality Certification program and will obtain necessary State and 

federal permits (e.g. San Francisco Bay Regional Water Quality Control Board, California 

Department of Fish and Wildlife, and/or the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers) before performing 

any maintenance that affects the preserved stream channel beds and banks. This includes 

preserved stream channels within the development area as well as activities on parcels under a 

deed restriction area unless the activities were previously authorized in the 401 Water Quality 

Certification. 

 

The Project Biologist as described in the WMP will be responsible for conducting all biological 

monitoring, as well as preparing all annual reports that will be submitted to the GHAD (Land 

Manager), Army Corps of Engineers (ACOE) and Regional Water Quality Control Board 

(RWQCB). The Project Biologist and Land Manager will exist in perpetuity pursuant to the 

terms of the deed restriction and the OSMP. 

 

2.3.2 General Landslide Mitigation 

 

The techniques the District may employ to prevent, mitigate or abate landsliding or adverse 

erosion damage might include, but are not necessarily limited to: 

 
 Removal of the unstable earth mass. 
 
 Stabilization (either partial or total) of the landslide by removal and replacement with 

compacted drained fill. 
 
 Construction of structures to retain or divert landslide material or sediment. 
 
 Construction of erosion-control devices such as gabions, rip rap, geotextiles or lined ditches. 
 
 Placement of drained engineered buttress fill. 
 
 Placement of subsurface drainage devices (e.g., underdrains or horizontal drains). 
 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 8 - 

 Slope correction (e.g., gradient change, biotechnical stabilization, and slope trimming or 
contouring). 

 
 Construction of additional surface ditches and/or detention basins, silt fences, sediment traps. 

 
 Placement of backfill in erosion channels. 

 

Potential landslide and erosion hazards can often best be mitigated by controlling soil saturation 

and water runoff and by maintaining the surface and subsurface drainage system. Maintenance 

shall be provided for lined surface drainage ditches and drainage terraces. 

 

2.4 BIOTECHNICAL RECOMMENDATIONS FOR PREVENTION 

AND MITIGATION OF EXISTING OR POTENTIAL EROSION HAZARDS 

 

Fill slopes within the boundaries of the District are expected to be erodible as will cut slopes in 

bedrock; therefore, the maintenance of vegetative cover is especially important. Vegetation 

provides a layer of protection on soil and exposed rock. It absorbs the impact of raindrops, 

reduces the velocity of runoff and retards erosion. 

 

In many instances, adequate erosion protection for slopes can be accomplished with carefully 

selected and placed biological elements (plants) without the use of structures (e.g., brush layering 

and willow waddling). 

 

In other areas, biotechnical slope protection may involve the use of mechanical elements or 

structures in combination with biological elements to provide erosion control and help prevent 

small-scale slope failures. Locally, walls, welded-wire walls, gabion walls, rock walls, riprap and 

reinforced earth walls used in combination with carefully selected and planted vegetation can 

provide high-quality slope protection. The vegetation may be planted on the slope above a low 

retaining structure or toe wall, or the interstices of the structure can be planted. 

 

2.5 CRITERIA FOR GHAD RESPONSIBILITY 

 

To establish an appropriate GHAD assessment level for the Rancho Laguna portion of the 

Moraga GHAD, it is important to clearly define the limits of the GHAD’s responsibilities. The 

GHAD will accept responsibility for property as described in Exhibit A. However, the intent of 

this Plan of Control is not to extend the GHAD’s responsibilities to every potential situation of 

slope instability; as such, the following are exclusions from GHAD responsibility. 

 

2.5.1 Isolated or Remote Slope Instability 

 

The GHAD shall not have responsibility to monitor, abate, mitigate or control slope instability 

that does not involve damage to, or pose a significant threat to damage, onsite improvements or 

flood control capacity. As used herein, the term “site improvements” means buildings, roads, 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 9 - 

sidewalks, utilities, retaining walls, improved trails, swimming pools, geologic stabilization 

features and drainage features or similar improvements. 

 

2.5.2 Single Property 

 

The GHAD will not prevent, mitigate, abate or control geologic hazards which are limited in 

area to a single residential parcel of property unless the geologic hazard has damaged, or poses a 

significant threat of damage to site improvements located on other property within the GHAD 

boundaries. 

 

2.5.3 Geologic Hazards Resulting From Negligence of Property Owner  

 

The GHAD may, in the GHAD manager’s sole discretion, decline to prevent, mitigate, abate or 

control geologic hazards which occur or result from any negligence of a homeowner and/or the 

homeowner’s contractors, agents or employees in developing, investigating, grading, 

constructing, maintaining or performing or not performing any post-development work on the 

subject property. 

 

2.5.4 Property Not Accepted  

 

The GHAD shall not have responsibility to repair damage that is situated on a parcel of real 

property, which the GHAD has not accepted in accordance with Exhibit E. The GHAD, 

however, may monitor, abate, mitigate or control slope instability on a parcel of real property, 

which the GHAD has not accepted in accordance with Exhibit E, provided that the GHAD 

responsibility on such parcel shall be limited to the extent necessary to address damage or a 

significant threat to damage site improvements on a GHAD-accepted parcel. 

 

2.5.5 Geologic Hazard Which Requires Expenditure in Amount Exceeding the Value of 

the Threatened or Damaged Improvement 

 

The GHAD may elect not to prevent, mitigate, abate or control a geologic hazard where, in the 

GHAD manager's sole discretion, the anticipated expenditure required to be funded by the 

GHAD to prevent, mitigate, abate or control the geologic hazard will exceed the value of the 

structure(s) and site improvement(s) threatened with damage or loss. 

 

2.5.6 GHAD Funding or Reimbursement for Damaged or Destroyed Structures or Site 

Improvements 

 

In the event a residence or any other private structure, site improvement or landscape feature is 

damaged or destroyed as a result of a geologic hazard, the District may fund or reimburse the 

property owner for the expenses necessary to repair or replace the damaged or destroyed 

structure, site improvement or landscaping. Unless otherwise authorized by the Board of 

Directors, the total dollar amount of the District funding or reimbursement paid to all property 

owners whose property is damaged by a geologic hazard may not exceed ten percent (10%) of 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 10 - 

the total costs incurred by the District in actually mitigating, abating or controlling the geologic 

hazard that causes the damage1. In the event the geologic hazard damages or destroys a structure, 

site improvement or landscaping which violates any provisions of the Town Building Code or 

Town Code at the time of its installation or improvement, the District may decline to provide any 

funding, or reimbursement to the property owner for repair or replacement of the damaged 

structure, improvement or landscaping. 

 

2.5.7 No Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Property Owners 

 

The GHAD will not be obligated to reimburse a property owner for expenses incurred for the 

prevention, mitigation, abatement, or control of a geologic hazard absent a written agreement 

between the property owner and the GHAD to that effect, which agreement has been executed 

prior to the property owner incurring said expenses, and following an investigation conducted by 

the GHAD. 

 

2.6 PRIORITY FOR DISTRICT-FUNDED REPAIRS 

 

Emergency response and scheduled monitoring, maintenance or repair expenditures are to be 

prioritized by the GHAD Manager, utilizing its discretion, based upon available funds, a prudent 

reserve and the approved operating budget. 

 

Should available funds not be sufficient to undertake all of the identified remedial and preventive 

stabilization measures, the expenditures shall be prioritized as follows in descending order of 

priority: 

 

A. The prevention, mitigation, abatement or control of geologic hazards that have either 

damaged or pose a significant threat of damage to residences, critical lifeline utilities or 

emergency vehicle access corridors. 

 

B. The prevention, mitigation, abatement or control of geologic hazards that have either 

damaged or pose a significant threat of damage to water quality basin improvements, 

wetlands, riparian features, vegetated swale, restored and unaltered creek channels including 

annual funding so that the facilities are maintained in accordance with the requirements of 

the WMP (Exhibit G). 

 

C. The prevention, mitigation, abatement or control of geologic hazards that have either 

damaged or pose a significant threat of damage to private recreation facilities (e.g., pools, 

spas, etc.). 

 

                                                 
1 For example, if a landslide causes $10,000 in structural damage to each one of four neighboring homes for a total 

of $40,000 in structural damage and it costs the District $100,000 to design and install a new retaining wall to abate 

the slide, the District may only reimburse each property owner $2,500 of their $10,000 in structural damage. 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 11 - 

D. The prevention, mitigation, abatement or control of geologic hazards that have either 

damaged or pose a significant threat of damage limited to loss of landscaping or other similar 

non-essential amenities. 

 

E. The prevention, mitigation, abatement or control of geologic hazards existing entirely on 

open-space property and which have neither damaged nor pose a significant threat of damage 

to any site improvements. 

 

If sufficient funds are not available to undertake the listed activities, the GHAD may investigate 

obtaining funding as allowed in Section 26505(e) of the Public Resources Code through the 

issuance of bonds, notes, or debentures such as a line of credit. 

 

2.7 MAINTENANCE AND MONITORING SCHEDULE 

 

Geologic features and District-maintained facilities should be inspected on a regular basis. 

Budget permitting, inspections should generally be scheduled to occur two times per year in 

normal years and three or more times per year in years with heavy rainfall events. A heavy 

rainfall event is defined as greater than 2 inches of rainfall in a 24-hour period. The inspections 

should be scheduled to take place in the fall, prior to the first significant rainfall; mid-winter as 

necessary during heavy rainfall years; and in spring at the end of the rainy season. 

 

 An Engineer and/or Geologist should carry out a geologic reconnaissance of the site slopes 

for indications of erosion or slope failures. Open space slope area monitoring would include 

observation of debris benches and trails. The removal of accumulated debris from the 

benches should be undertaken in a manner that maintains the capacity of the bench to protect 

site improvements. 

 

 Monitoring of the creek banks will be performed on a regular basis to identify areas of 

possible instability or future erosion. Creek bank erosion that does not directly threaten site 

improvements including flood control capacity, as provided in Section 2.5.1, will not be 

repaired, and the creeks will be allowed to mature naturally. All necessary permits will be 

obtained before mitigation work proceeds. 

 

 Monitoring of the unpaved trail system should include observing the trail for excess 

vegetation growth, eroded areas or areas of instability. It is anticipated that mowing of the 

trails would occur annually in late spring and that recontouring of portions of the trail may be 

necessary approximately every 3 to 5 years. 

 

 A District Engineer and/or Geologist should inspect the surface of concrete-lined drainage 

ditches within the District boundaries on a regular schedule. Repairs and maintenance should 

be performed as needed. Excess silt or sediment in ditches should be removed and cracked or 

broken ditches should be patched or repaired as required before the beginning of the next 

rainy season. 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 12 - 

 Subsurface drain outlets and horizontal drain outlets, if any, should be inspected on a regular 

schedule. Water flowing from these outlets should be measured and recorded during each 

inspection. 

 

 If installed, piezometers used to measure groundwater levels, or other instruments such as 

inclinometers, tiltmeters, and/or settlement-monitoring devices, should be monitored on a 

regular schedule. In the event of anomalous readings, the monitoring frequency should be 

increased. 

 

 Inlets, outfalls or trash racks, if used, must be kept free of debris, and spillways must be 

maintained. Attention should be given to plantings or other obstructions, which may interfere 

with access by power equipment. 

 

 The water-quality/detention basins and associated improvements shall be monitored and 

maintained in accordance with an approved operations and maintenance manual. 

 

 An Engineer and/or Geologist should carry out an inspection of the developer-constructed 

retaining walls to verify their condition and performance. 

 

 Inspection of fuel management zones on GHAD owned parcels shall be accomplished in 

accordance with a fuel management program approved by the Moraga-Orinda Fire District. 

 

The District should review its inspection schedule annually and assess the effectiveness of its 

preventive maintenance program on a regular basis. District staff should prepare an annual report 

to the Board of Directors with recommendations for maintenance and/or repair projects. 

Consultants, as necessary, may be retained to undertake the needed studies. The District 

Engineer and/or Engineering Geologist retained by the District shall prepare an annual inspection 

report for presentation to the District Board of Directors. 

 

3.0 GLOSSARY 
 

Engineer’s Report – The document that establishes the individual property owners’ GHAD 

assessment based on the projected expenses (budget) of the GHAD. 

 

Geological Hazard Abatement District (GHAD) Manager – An entity employing a licensed 

Geotechnical Engineer who will oversee the operations of the GHAD including preparation of 

GHAD budgets. The GHAD Manager is hired by and reports to the GHAD Board of Directors. 

 

Project Biologist – The Project Biologist is responsible for conducting all biological monitoring 

as well as preparing annual reports that will be submitted to the Land Manager, Conservation 

Easement Manager, third-party beneficiaries and Regulatory Agencies (Resources Management 

Plan). The Project Biologist will be employed through the GHAD. 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 13 - 

Land Manager – The Land Manager shall implement the long-term management plan and 

manage and monitor Parcels A, B, and D in perpetuity to preserve its habitat and conservation 

values in accordance with the Deed Restriction, WMP, and the Open Space Management Plan. 

The Land Manager function will be fulfilled through the GHAD. 

 

Regulatory Agencies – Includes the San Francisco Bay Regional Water Quality Control Board, 

United States Army Corp of Engineers, and California Department of Fish and Wildlife. 

 

4.0 OWNERSHIP AND MANAGEMENT 
 

Ownership, funding sources and maintenance responsibilities shall be as shown on the following 

table and Figures 1A through 1C.  

 

TABLE 4.0-1 

RANCHO LAGUNA RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT/MORAGA GHAD 

Long-Term Ownership and Management Matrix 

Facility/Function 
Maintenance 

Entity 
Funding 

Tentative 

Acceptance Date 

or Minimum 

Initial 

Monitoring 

Term 

Ownership 

1. Development Area 

a. Single-Family Residences     

i. General Lot Conditions  Private Private Not applicable Private 

ii. Backyard with GHAD 

Access Agreement 

(Vegetation Management) 

GHAD Assessment 3 Years Private 

iii. Easement for GHAD Storm 

Drainage Improvements  
GHAD Assessment 3 Years Private 

b. Private Streets HOA HOA Not applicable HOA 

c. Storm Drain System HOA HOA Not applicable HOA 

d. Water      

i. Main Pipeline EBMUD EBMUD Not applicable EBMUD 

ii. Laterals Private Private Not applicable Private 

e. Sanitary Sewer     

i. Main Pipeline 
CCCSD or 

HOA 
CCCSD or HOA Not applicable 

CCCSD or 

HOA 

ii. Laterals Private Private Not applicable Private 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 14 - 

Facility/Function 
Maintenance 

Entity 
Funding 

Tentative 

Acceptance Date 

or Minimum 

Initial 

Monitoring 

Term 

Ownership 

2. GHAD-Owned Open Space Areas with a Deed Restriction (Parcels A, B, and D) 

Wetland Mitigation Program  

(Pre Final Success Criteria Achievement) 

a. Irrigated Landscaping 
Developer/ 

HOA 

Private 

Funding/HOA 
Not Applicable 

Developer/ 

GHAD 

b. Site Monitoring Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

c. Weed and Exotic Plant Control Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

d. Supplemental Irrigation Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

e. Protective Devices Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

f. Plant Replacement Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

g. Signage Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

h. Flow Conveyance and Erosion 

Control 
Developer Private Funding 5 Years Developer 

Plan of Control Defined Activities  

(3-Year Minimum Initial Monitoring Period) 

a. Invasive Species Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

b. Detention Basin Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

c. Storm Drain System Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

d. Vegetation Management for Fire 

Suppression 
Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

e. Slopes and Surface Drainage 

Improvements 
Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

f. Subdrains Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

g. Fire/Emergency Vehicle Access 

Roads 
Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

h. Gates and Fencing Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

i. Pedestrian Trail and Bridge Developer Private Funding 3 Years Developer 

j. Pacific Gas and Electric Company 

(PG&E) 
    

i. Towers PG&E PG&E Not Applicable Developer 

ii. Roads PG&E PG&E Not Applicable Developer 

k. Land Lease Agreements     

i. AT&T AT&T AT&T Not Applicable Developer 

ii. Verizon Verizon Verizon Not Applicable Developer 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 15 - 

Facility/Function 
Maintenance 

Entity 
Funding 

Tentative 

Acceptance Date 

or Minimum 

Initial 

Monitoring 

Term 

Ownership 

Wetland Mitigation Program  

(Post Final Success Criteria Achievement) 

a. Site Monitoring GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

b. Weed Control GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

c. Plant Replacement GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

d. Flow Conveyance and Erosion 

Control 
GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

e. Minimize Harmful Intrusions GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

Plan of Control Defined Activities  

(Post Initial Monitoring Period) 

a. Invasive Species GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

b. Detention Basin GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

c. Storm Drain System GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

d. Vegetation Management for Fire 

Suppression 
GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

e. Slopes and Surface Drainage 

Improvements 
GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

f. Subdrains GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

g. Fire/Emergency Vehicle Access 

Roads 
GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

h. Gates and Fencing GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

i. Pedestrian Trail and Bridge GHAD Assessment Perpetual GHAD 

j. Pacific Gas and Electric Company 

(PG&E) 
    

i. Towers PG&E PG&E Not Applicable GHAD 

ii. Roads PG&E PG&E Not Applicable GHAD 

l. Land Lease Agreements     

i. AT&T AT&T AT&T Not Applicable GHAD 

ii. Verizon Verizon Verizon Not Applicable GHAD 

 

5.0 RIGHT-OF-ENTRY 
 

District officers, employees, consultants, contractors, agents, and representatives shall have the 

right to enter upon all lands within the District boundary, as shown on Exhibit B, for the purpose 

of performing the activities described in the Rancho Laguna GHAD Plan of Control. Should the 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 - 16 - 

District need to access parcels owned by the Homeowner’s Association or private residential lots 

to fulfill its duties under the Plan of Control, the District shall provide the affected landowner 

and/or resident with 72 hours advanced notice unless, in the reasonable judgment of the GHAD 

Manager, an emergency situation exists which makes immediate access necessary to protect the 

public health and safety, in which case no advanced notice is required, but the District shall 

inform the landowner and/or resident as soon as reasonably possible. 

 

The owner or owners of property within the Rancho Laguna development shall record a 

Declaration of Restrictive Covenants, Right of Entry and Disclosures Regarding Geologic 

Hazard Abatement District (“Declaration”) after recordation of the Parcel Map, in the form 

attached as Appendix F. The Declaration creates covenants that run with the land and will be 

binding upon all future owners of property within the Rancho Laguna development, their 

successors and assigns. 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 

REFERENCES 
 

1. ENGEO, Geotechnical Exploration, Rancho Laguna, Rheem Boulevard, Moraga, California, 

Project Number 2655.001.000, May 30, 2013. 

 

2. ENGEO, Corrective Grading Plan, Rancho Laguna, Rheem Boulevard, Moraga, California, 

Project Number 2655.001.000, Revised April 2015. 

 

3. ENGEO, Supplemental Geotechnical Exploration for Sewer Pipeline, Rancho Laguna, 

Rheem Boulevard, Moraga, California, Project Number 2655.001.000, May 17, 2013. 

 

4. P/A Design Resources, General Development Plan/Vesting Tentative Map (VTM), Rancho 

Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga, California; Project Number 12009-10, 

February 19, 2014. 

 

5. P/A Design Resources, Grading Plans, Rancho Laguna II, Subdivision 9330, Moraga, 

California; Project Number 12009-20, May 20, 2015. 

 

6. P/A Design Resources, Improvement Plans, Rancho Laguna II, Subdivision 9330, Moraga, 

California; Project Number 12009-20, May 20, 2015. 

 

7. P/A Design Resources, Subdivision 9330 Off-Tract Improvement Rheem Boulevard Grading 

Plans, Moraga, California; Project Number 12009-20, May 20, 2015. 

 

8. P/A Design Resources, Subdivision 9330 Off-Tract Improvement Rheem Boulevard 

Improvement Plans, Moraga, California; Project Number 12009-20, May 20, 2015. 

 

9. Zentner and Zentner, Wetlands Mitigation Plan, Rancho Laguna, Moraga, California; 

Project Number 980 SSH, June 2014. 

 

10. Moraga Town of, Resolution No. 05-2014, Planning Commission Conditions of Approval, 

Rancho Laguna Subdivision, Moraga, California, April 21, 2014. 

 

11. Wildland Resources Management, Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan, Rancho Laguna, 

SummerHill Homes, Moraga, California, April 15, 2015. 

 

 



 

 
 

FIGURES 
 

 

Figures 1A through 1C - Open Space and Improvements Ownership/Maintenance Plan 

Figures 2 and 2A – Corrective Grading Plan 

Figure 3 – Corrective Grading Plan Details 

Figure 4 –Regional Geologic Map 

 

F

I

G

U

R

E

S  









C

T

GP-6

TP-41

4

TP-4

11

2-TP-28

2

2-B9
8

1-B3

B-3-05
23

B10
6

3
30



C

T

Qaf
Qc

Tmll(cs)

Qal
Tmll(ss)

GP-6

TP-41

 4

TP-4

 11

2-TP-28

 2

3
30

2-B9
8

1-B3

B-3-05
23

B10
6

Tus



(SEE TYPICAL SUBDRAIN DETAILS)

WHERE LOTS ARE PARTIALLY IN FILL, AND PARTIALLY IN CUT,
THE CUT PORTION MUST BE OVEREXCAVATED AS SHOWN

1-B3
1-B2

1-B1

2-B6

Qal

Qaf

Qal

Tmll(ss)

Qal

Qaf

2-B6

Tmll(ss)

B7

1-B1

2-B6

Qls

21

3

B-2-05

Qls

2-B5

2-B2

2-B3

2-B4

Qls

Qc

Tmll(ss)

Tmll(ss)

Tmll(ss)
Tmll(ss)

Tmll(ss)

Tmll(ss)

Qls

Qls

TP-18

TP-16

Qc

2-TP-12





 

 
 

 

EXHIBIT A 
 

 

Legal Description for Subdivision 9330 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T 

  

A 





 

 
 

 

EXHIBIT B 
 

 

Plat to Accompany Legal Description for Subdivision 9330, Boundary Exhibit 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T 

 

 B 





 

 
 

 

EXHIBIT C 
 

 

RANCHO LAGUNA  

Authority and Proposed Development 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T 

 

 C 
 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 C - 1 

AUTHORITY 

 

The Moraga Town Council formed the Moraga Geologic Hazard Abatement District (“GHAD” 

or “District”) on _______, 2014 with approval of Resolution __-__, under authority of the 

California Public Resources Code (Division 17, commencing with Section 26500). Included 

within the District were the Hetfield Estates, Palos Colorados, and Rancho Laguna 

developments. The Moraga Town Council members act as the Board of Directors of the Moraga 

GHAD. 

 

Section 26509 of the Public Resources Code requires a Plan of Control, prepared by a 

State-Certified Engineering Geologist, as a prerequisite to formation of a GHAD. An 

Engineering Geologist, certified pursuant to Section 7822 of the Business and Professions Code, 

prepared the original Plan of Control for the Rancho Laguna portion of the Moraga GHAD. The 

Business and Professions Code requires a Plan of Control to describe in detail geologic hazards, 

their location, who is affected by them, and most significantly, a plan for the prevention, 

mitigation, abatement, or control thereof. This Plan of Control applies GHAD operations within 

the area described in Exhibit A and shown graphically on Exhibit B. 

 

PROPOSED DEVELOPMENT 

 

Grading and improvement plans for the project have been prepared by P/A Design Resources 

dated November, 2014. The plans indicate that the 178.9-acre property will be developed with 

approximately 27 single-family residential lots within a development area of approximately 

26.3 acres. The lots will be situated in two areas with 10 residential parcels located adjacent to 

Rheem Boulevard and a second group of 17 residential parcels located in the southern portion of 

the subdivision.  

 

Based on the grading plans provided by P/A Design Resources Inc., dated November 4, 2014, 

proposed grading at the project site consists of cuts up to approximately 20 feet deep and fills up to 

about 50 feet thick to achieve relatively level building pads and interior access roads. A majority of 

design cut slopes planned are associated with Fay Hill Road and Street ‘E’ and are as steep as 

2:1 (horizontal:vertical) and up to about 30 feet high. Design fills vary in thickness across the site; 

up to about 29 feet along Rheem Boulevard and 50 feet near Lot 17 where an approximately  

100-foot-high 2:1 slope is proposed. The project design includes two water quality/detention 

basins.  



 

 
 

 

EXHIBIT D 
 

 

RANCHO LAGUNA  

Geology 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

D 
 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 D - 1 

REGIONAL GEOLOGY AND GEOLOGIC MAPS 

 

The site is located within the Coast Ranges geologic province of California, a series of 

northwest-trending ridges and valleys. Regional geologic maps were reviewed as part of the 

Geotechnical Exploration Report for the Rancho Laguna site. A published geologic map of the 

site vicinity (Graymer, 1994) indicates that the site is underlain by Mulholland formation 

(Figure 4). The formation consists of two units, a predominately sandstone/siltstone unit and a 

claystone unit. The Rancho Laguna development is situated on the east limb of the Mulholland 

syncline, west of the mapped Las Trampas fault. Graymer maps bedrock structure striking to the 

northwest and dipping to the southwest at inclinations of 30 to 40 degrees.  

 

SITE GEOLOGY 

 

The geologic units mapped on the site include bedrock and surficial deposits consisting of fill, 

alluvium, colluvium, and landslide. The geologic units described below are adapted from a 

geotechnical exploration report completed by ENGEO for the site in 2013 and are shown on 

Figure 2. 

 

GEOLOGIC UNITS 

 

Existing Fill. As described in the Geotechnical Exploration Report, an existing fill was placed in 

conjunction with the development of the Fay Hill Reservoir site. The fill appears to be derived 

from a cut in the local bedrock formation, the Mulholland formation. As reported, the fill is up to 

about 28 feet in thickness. Other artificial fill areas were identified as small fills made for 

existing ranch roads. The existing fill locations are approximately shown on the Corrective 

Grading Plan (Figure 2). 

 

Landslides. The onsite landslides have been classified as either recently active or dormant, and 

are described as soil slumps, earth flows, or deep-seated landslides (Figure 2). Recent landslides 

were identified based on bare, near-vertical head scarps and fairly obvious toe bulges and lateral 

margins. Dormant landslides are older landslides that have been modified by erosion. Dormant 

landslides generally have vegetated scarps and subtle toe or lateral margins.  

 

Surficial landslides involve primarily soil but may include some highly weathered bedrock 

material. Test pit exploration indicates that the surficial landslides range from about 5 to 20 feet 

thick. The surficial landslides in the study area appear to include slumps and earthflow type 

slides. Slumps move relatively slowly as a somewhat coherent mass. With continued movement 

and saturation, slumps sometimes become earthflows, which are a more rapidly moving 

viscous-flow type of landslide.  

 

Many of the identified landslide areas are landslide complexes that contain coalescing slide 

segments. The larger, deep-seated landslides generally have displaced blocks of bedrock in the 

downslope portions of the landslide area and surficial slumps and earthflow segments in the 

steeper upslope portions of the landslide area. 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 D - 2 

Residual Soil. Residual soils develop essentially in place from weathering of the underlying 

parent material. Residual soils were encountered on ridgelines and the flanks of ridges and were 

found to range from about 1 to 5 feet thick. The residual soils encountered consist of dark brown 

silty clay. The residual soils have a moderate to high expansion potential. 

 

Colluvium. Areas of thicker soil cover in swales are shown as colluvium (Qc) on Figure 2. 

Colluvial soils encountered in test pits consist of fine-grained sediments that have a high 

plasticity and a high expansion potential. The colluvial deposits encountered were soft to stiff 

and range up to about 19 feet thick. 

 

Alluvium. Alluvium (Qal) was encountered along the drainage adjacent to Rheem Boulevard. 

Alluvial soils encountered consisted of unconsolidated stream deposits of silty clay with some 

sand clay layers. The alluvial deposits range up to at least 15 feet thick in some areas.  

 

Mulholland Formation. Bedrock at the site is mapped by Graymer (1994) as the lower member 

of the Mulholland formation. Based on the bedrock materials encountered onsite, bedrock was 

subdivided into two units:  (1) a unit consisting predominantly of sandstone and siltstone that is 

designated Tmll (ss), and (2) a unit that consists predominantly of claystone that is designated 

Tmll (cs). The sandstone and siltstone vary from very weak to moderately strong, moderately to 

highly fractured and thinly to thickly bedded. The sandstone and siltstone unit are more resistant 

to erosion than the claystone and generally underlies the ridgeline portions of the site. The 

claystone unit is generally extremely weak to weak, closely fractured and thinly bedded. The 

claystone unit underlies the eastern portion of the site and is generally more prone to slope 

instability than the sandstone and siltstone units. 

 

Bedrock structure observed in test pit excavations was consistent with the regional mapping. 

Bedding attitudes were observed dipping to the north, northwest and dipping at inclinations of 28 

to 60 degrees to the west. 

 

GROUNDWATER 

 

During the site explorations conducted between 1983 and 2013, groundwater was encountered in 

several exploratory soil borings. Groundwater levels ranged between 20 and 30 feet below the 

existing ground surface. In addition, flow was observed in the channel adjacent to Rheem 

Boulevard. As noted in the Geotechnical Exploration, groundwater conditions are expected to 

vary depending on factors such as weather conditions, time of year and future irrigation 

practices. 

 

SEISMIC SOURCES 

 

The site is not located within a State of California Earthquake Fault Zone and no Holocene active 

faults are known to pass through the project site, according to published geologic maps 

(Jennings, 2010; Graymer, 2000; Crane, 1988; Dibblee, 2005; and Bortugno, 1991). 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 D - 3 

Crane (1988) maps a southwest dipping thrust fault in the valley along Rheem Boulevard. 

Another unnamed fault is mapped a few hundred feet to the northeast of the site (Graymer, 2000 

and Crane, 1988). No geomorphic expressions of recent faulting were observed in aerial 

photographs, during our site reconnaissance or in the test pits. 

 



 

 
 

 

EXHIBIT E 
 

 

RANCHO LAGUNA  

Funding and Acceptance 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

E 
 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 E - 1 

FUNDING AND ACCEPTANCE OF RESPONSIBILITY BY THE DISTRICT 

 

An annual assessment shall be levied on all residential parcels within the Rancho Laguna 

development. 

 

1. Activation of Assessment 

 

The assessment shall be levied by the GHAD on each individual parcel beginning the first fiscal 

year (July 1 through June 30) following the close of escrow  for that parcel.  

 

2. Responsibility for GHAD Activities 

 

The party that, on the date each Final Map is recorded within the GHAD boundaries, owns the 

developable parcels shown on that Final Map shall have the responsibility to perform all the 

activities of the GHAD on property within that Final Map. Such responsibility shall 

automatically transfer to the GHAD at 9:00 a.m. on the day exactly three (3) years after the first 

residential building permit within the area is issued by the Town of Moraga provided that the 

items listed under item No. 3 in this section have been completed (Transfer Eligibility Date). 

This turnover date may be extended at the sole discretion of the project developer provided that 

the assessments shall continue to be levied during the extension period and that notice of such 

extension is delivered to the GHAD Manager at least 30 days prior to the turnover date. 

 

3. Process for Transferring Responsibility for GHAD Activities 

 

After the Transfer Eligibility Date for parcel(s), the process for transferring responsibility for 

performing GHAD activities on such parcel(s) shall be as follows: 

 

(a) The owner or owners of property within the Site shall record a Declaration of Restrictive 

Covenants, Right of Entry and Disclosures Regarding Geologic Hazard Abatement District 

(“Declaration”) previously approved by the GHAD. 

 

(b) Up to one year in advance of the Transfer Eligibility Date or in any subsequent year, at its 

discretion, the developer may apply to the GHAD ("Transfer Application") to transfer the 

responsibility for performing GHAD Activities for parcel(s) to the District. 

 

(c) Within 45 days of receiving such notice, a representative of the GHAD shall verify that all 

the facilities for which the GHAD will have maintenance responsibility have been 

constructed and maintained according to the Town-approved plans and specifications for the 

individual improvements, and that such facilities are operational and in good working order. 

 

(d) Within 15 days of such inspection, the GHAD will send the developer a list ("Punch list") of 

all of the items that need to be constructed, repaired or otherwise modified. 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 E - 2 

(e) The developer may notify the GHAD when it has completed the items identified on the 

Punch list.  

 

(f) Within 30 days of receipt of such notice, the GHAD shall verify whether all Punch List items 

have been completed. If such items have been completed, the GHAD shall notify the 

developer that the District accepts responsibility for performing all future GHAD Activities 

on the parcel(s). 

 

(g) The GHAD Manager shall confirm that the reserve requirement defined in the approved 

Engineer’s Report has been met. 

 

(h) Ownership of the open space shall be transferred from the owner/developers to the District. 

 

(i) The GHAD must review, approve, and the developer or HOA must record an access and 

maintenance easement for HOA activities on GHAD owned parcels. 

 

As part of the transfer, the developer of parcel(s) to be transferred will provide the GHAD, for its 

use, copies of the applicable geotechnical exploration reports, grading plans, corrective grading 

plans, improvement plans, field-verified geologic maps, as-built subdrain plans or other pertinent 

documents as requested by the GHAD. 

 



 

 

 

EXHIBIT F 
 

 

MORAGA GEOLOGIC HAZARD ABATEMENT DISTRICT 

Rancho Laguna Development 

GHAD Disclosure and Right of Access 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

F 
 













 

 

EXHIBIT G 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Development 

Wetland Management Program 

June 2014 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

G 































































































































 

 

 

EXHIBIT H 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Development 

Open Space Management Plan 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

H 





























































































 

 

 

EXHIBIT I 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan 

April 15, 2015 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

I 
 





Table of Contents 
 
SUMMARY  

SECTION ONE – EXISTING CONDITIONS 
A. Project Setting 3 

1. General Location of Project 3 
2. Description of the Project 3 
3. Description of Adjacent Properties 5 

B. Regulatory Context 5 
1. Fire Safety Regulations - Ordinance No. 13-01 5 
2. Exterior Fire Hazard Control 5 
3. Other Conditions and Restrictions 6 
4. Easements 6 

C. Site-Specific Assessment of Fire Hazard and Risk 7 
1. Wildland Fuels on the Project Site 7 
2. General Weather Information 7 
3. Local Weather Conditions 8 
4. Terrain on Project Site and Surroundings 9 
5. Predicted Fire Behavior of Project Site and Surroundings with No Mitigations 9 
6. Fire History of the Area 12 
7. CAL FIRE Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Mapping 12 
8. Anticipated Fire Threat from and to Adjoining Properties 12 

SECTION TWO – FIRE HAZARD MITIGATION MEASURES 
A. Introduction 14 
B. Principles Guiding Vegetation Management 14 
C. Summary of Vegetative Fuel Management Zones 14 
D. Standards for Non-Combustible Zone (Zone 0) 15 
E. Standards for Defensible Space/Landscaping Zone (Zone I) 16 
F. Open Space Vegetation Management for Fire Hazard Reduction (Zone II) 20 
G. Standards for Trailside Fuel Management Zone (Zone IV) 21 
H. Standards for Roadside Vegetation Management 21 
I. Wetland Mitigation Fuel Management (Zone III) 21 
J. Statement Regarding Compliance with Fire Safety Codes and Regulations 21 

SECTION THREE – IMPLEMENTATION MECHANISMS 
A. Homeowner and Homeowner Association Responsibilities 23 
B. Delegation of Fuel Management and Construction Responsibilities 24 
C.  Phasing of Maintenance Responsibility and Fuel Management 24 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   ii 
 

D. Mechanisms for Compliance 25 
E. Frequency of Future Maintenance 25 

APPENDICES 
A. Fuel Type and Fire Behavior in Different Fuels 27 
B. Species List for Prohibited Landscaping Plants 30 
C. Selection of Fire Resistant Landscaping 31 
D. Key Terminology 32 
E. Hydrant/Fire Service Requirements 33 
 
 



 
 
 
 

WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN 
Rancho Laguna 

Rheem Blvd., Moraga, California 
  
 

Summary 
     
This Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan (“Plan”) for the Rancho Laguna II residential 
subdivision (“Project”) meets the requirements established by the Moraga-Orinda Fire District 
Ordinance 13-01 (2010 California Fire Code).  The Plan addresses the following items related to 
wildfire hazards: 

 Provision of access for fire apparatus,  
 Provision of water supply for fire protection, and  
 Provisions to control the spread of fire.  

 
The Plan also is intended to meet the Town of Moraga’s Conditions of Approval for the Project 
to provide a Fire Protection Plan as part of the Open Space Management Plan. The Plan will 
ensure that: 

 The Project design is consistent with the Town’s emergency evacuation plan. 
 The water supply is adequate for fire suppression, in terms of flow, pressure, hydrant 

location and compliance with fire codes.  
 Emergency response vehicles have full access to the site. 
 Residences have fully compliant fire sprinklers. 
 The project shall pay fire flow tax.  

 
The Plan describes existing conditions and proposed fuel modifications that will direct 
maintenance of landscaping and open space areas.  The Plan describes actions needed to 
maintain fuels (both vegetative and structural) in a fire-safe condition.  The proposed fuel 
modifications will decrease fire intensity, facilitate fire suppression, and reduce property loss.  
The Plan recommends development and maintenance of a defensible space zone for 100 feet 
from each structure and 10 feet from roadside edge to help ensure fire safety.  Open space 
management will prevent shrubby growth in the grassland areas.  
 
The Plan designates areas to be cultivated regularly and requires areas of irrigated landscaping 
using fire resistant species.  The Plan complies with the Town of Moraga’s conditions of 
approval for the mitigation measures regarding erosion control, biotechnical slope stabilization 
and preservation of woodland and riparian vegetation.   
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   2 

To make vegetation management easier to implement, the Plan does the following: 
 Delineates vegetation fuel management zones.  
 Establishes appropriate treatments for each zone.  
 Sets record-keeping and reporting requirements and mechanisms for enforcement.  

 
In addition, the Plan provides information on fire-resistant and drought-tolerant landscaping so 
that homeowners can protect their properties against wildland fire.  This Plan also addresses fire-
resistant design and construction, based on the Moraga-Orinda Fire District Ordinance 13-01. 
  
The Plan will be implemented by the Project Developer, the Moraga Geologic Hazard 
Abatement District (“GHAD”), the Homeowners Association, and the individual homeowners.  
The Project Developer will be responsible for implanting the Plan during construction and until 
lots are conveyed to individual owners and the Homeowners Association.   After the Project 
Developer conveys the open space areas to the GHAD, the GHAD will be responsible for 
implementing the Plan with regard to the open space areas and the unfenced back areas of the 
private lots.  The Homeowners Association will be responsible for implementing the Plan in the 
common area lots, and individual homeowners will be responsible for implementing the Plan and 
within the front yards and fenced areas of their private lots. 
  
Under current environmental conditions and with mitigation measures in place, fire behavior at 
the Project site will be generally less than two-foot flame length within 100 feet of a structure. 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   3

– Section One – 
EXISTING CONDITIONS 

 
A. PROJECT SETTING 
 
1. General Location of Project 
 
The 178.9-acre project site is located in the Town of Moraga bounded by Rheem Blvd to 
the west, single-family residences to the southwest, St. Mary’s Road and Las Trampas 
Creek to the south and southeast, and existing open space to the north and east.   
 
2. Description of the Project 
 
The project consists of 27 new single-family homes on approximately 17 acres and 
dedicated open space on approximately 162 acres. The site consists of a grassy prominent 
steep-sided ridge and two narrow valleys. The east-facing slopes are covered with 
expanses of grass, with woodlands; the west-facing slope is grassy with woody 
vegetation in narrow drainages and along Rheem Blvd.  Ten of the new homes will be 
located at the base of the slope near Rheem Boulevard, and seventeen of the homes will 
be located higher on the slope on the southeast side of the main northwest-southeast ridge 
than runs through the site. 
 
Access is provided by one road (Fay Hill Road) off Rheem Blvd.  Fronteras Drive serves 
10 homes a short distance off Rheem Blvd.  Fay Hill Road rises up the steep slope to 
Sonora Road, which traverses the ridgeline approximately one-half mile south to the site 
of seventeen homes on Sonora Road and Los Santos Court.  All roads are at least 20 feet 
wide, and Fay Hill Rd is 26 feet wide in some places. An emergency vehicle access 
easement runs from the southern end of Fronteras Drive to Rheem Blvd.  Emergency 
vehicle access inside the open space is provided by a series of old ranch roads and a 20-
foot-wide public trail easement.  These access routes link adjacent open spaces and 
development, starting at the staging area near the intersection of Fay Hill Road and 
Sonora Road.  
 
The Moraga Geologic Hazard Abatement District (“Moraga GHAD” or “GHAD”) will 
be responsible for long-term management of the open space, guided by an Open Space 
Management Plan. Moraga GHAD responsibilities, as provided in the Open Space 
Management Plan, will begin a minimum of three years after issuance of the first 
building permit within the Rancho Laguna development. Prior to the Moraga GHAD 
acquiring monitoring, maintenance, and ownership responsibilities as provided in the 
Plan of Control, GHAD tasks within the Open Space Management Plan will be the 
responsibility of and funded by the developer. 
 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   4

 
 Figure 1. Project Context Aerial and Site Plan  
 
Structures will generally be constructed with ignition-resistant design and materials.  
Landscaping is guided by Homeowners Association Design Review Guidelines or other 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   5

similar review process.  For the lots along Sonora Road and Los Santos Court, back yard 
fencing will use non-combustible material such as wire (with wood posts), but side 
fencing will be built with solid wood and wood lattice for the top one foot.  The lattice 
will be constructed of timber at least one-inch nominal thickness (or other non-
combustible material) within five feet of the outside walls of the homes.  For the lots 
along Fronteras Drive, the back and side yard fencing will be built with solid wood and 
wood lattice for the top one foot. 
 
3. Description of Adjacent Properties 
 
Adjacent properties include both developed and undeveloped parcels.  Immediately east 
of the Project site is the dedicated open space of Palos Colorados. The southeastern 
border of the Project site abuts undeveloped open space.  Single family residences are 
located adjacent to the southwest side of the Project site (along Rheem Blvd) and 
approximately 350 to the northwest of the Project site (off Buckingham Drive).  In 
addition, backyards of single family homes on Birchwood Drive comprise the top of the 
slope to the west of the project.  Multi-family structures are located to the west of Rheem 
Blvd., off Via Barcelona and Woodminster Drive.  .  
 
B. REGULATORY CONTEXT 
 
1. Fire Safety Regulations - Ordinance No. 13-01 
 
The Project is within the service area of the Moraga-Orinda Fire District (“MOFD”).  
MOFD has adopted the California Fire Code, 2013 edition, including Appendix Chapters 
A, B, C, E, F, G, H, I, J, and the International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, with certain 
amendments.  (See MOFD Ordinance 13-01.)  
  
The Project design complies with the applicable provisions of the California Fire Code, 
2013 edition, including Appendix Chapters A, B, C, E, F, G, H, I, J, and the International 
Fire Code, 2012 Edition.  The Project is not within a High Fire Hazard Severity Zone and 
therefore is not subject to California Fire Code Chapter 7A. 
 
The MOFD Fire Marshal has reviewed and approved the access for fire apparatus and the 
water supply for fire protection for the Project.  The Fire Marshal approved an exception 
to the general water supply standards to allow a fire flow of 1,500 gpm from one adjacent 
hydrant.  The Project otherwise complies with all MOFD standards regarding fire access 
and water supply.   
 
A copy of the Fire Marshal’s approval is attached as Appendix E. 
 
2. Exterior Fire Hazard Control 
 
The 2014 Exterior Fire Hazard Control Standards for Vegetation Management requires 
all landowners with parcels smaller than one acre to:    

 Keep grass shorter than 3 inches during the fire season. 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   6

 Maintain trees adjacent to or overhanging structures free of dead or dying 
material. 

 Remove any portion of a tree within 10 feet of an outlet of a chimney or 
stovepipe. 

 Remove any lower branches of tree up to 6 feet in height above ground. 
 Remove hazard trees1.   
 Maintain an area 15 feet from structures clear of combustible materials. 
 

The same MOFD standard requires that the open space parcel comply with a different set 
of vegetation management treatments:  

 Parcels will be treated to create 30-foot-wide firebreaks and crossbreaks, to divide 
the parcel into approximately 5-acre sections.   

 Active pastureland may have 15-foot-wide firebreaks and crossbreaks (rather than 
30-foot wide) if the height of the grass during summer months is kept to 3 inches 
or less. 

 
3. Other Conditions and Restrictions  
 
Conditions of approval relating to conservation easements as well as environmental 
conditions and ownership of open space can affect the fire hazard by placing limitations 
on maintenance, or by creating an interface between developed and wildland fuels. 
 
The Town of Moraga imposed conditions of approval on the Project. These conditions 
state that the Moraga GHAD will be responsible for open space management, that it may 
use grazing as a management technique except for certain locations.  In addition, several 
deed restrictions pertain to wildland fire hazard reduction and open space management.  
Neither the conditions of approval nor the deed restrictions would prohibit 
implementation of this WHAP or compliance with State and local codes regarding fire 
management. 
 
4. Easements   

 
A 150 KV electrical transmission line traverses the project site east of the developed lots.  
Electrical power lines can be a source of ignition. The distribution lines are to be 
underground, and therefore not an ignition source. In response, the easement for this 
tower entails a requirement that the vegetation around the tower is kept free of 
vegetation.  PG&E is required to ensure that the vegetation is managed each year around 
each tower before the fire season starts – usually ten feet from the tower in all directions, 
if certain fire producing equipment is on the tower. 

                                                 
1 Hazard trees are those that are at risk of falling and causing damage or that are dead or dying and beyond 
saving with pruning. 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   7

 
C. SITE-SPECIFIC ASSESSMENT OF FIRE HAZARD AND RISK 
 
The site-specific assessment of the project’s fire hazard is based upon an analysis of the 
fuels, weather and topography that influence fire behavior. The potential effectiveness of 
fire suppression efforts as influenced by access and water supply on the project site is 
included in the analysis.  
 
1. Wildland Fuels on the Project Site 
 
The vegetative fuels on the project site are annual grasses (Fire Behavior Prediction 
System [FBPS] Fuel Model #1, oak woodland (FBPS Fuel Model #8) and patches of 
north coastal scrub (FBPS Fuel Model #5).  Grass covers the vast majority of the site and 
most of the areas closest to structures.  Oak/bay woodlands are located below and east of 
structures on Sonora Road and deep in drainages on east-facing slopes elsewhere in the 
open space.  Shrubby fuels, comprised of linear strings of willows in moisture areas in 
lower elevations or coyote brush in patches on steep uplands sites and along Coyote 
Creek and Rheem Blvd., are a significant component of the fuel complex. Figure 2 is a 
map of the different types of fuels on the project site. 
 
2. General Weather Information 
 
Weather conditions significantly impact both the potential for fire ignition and the rate, 
intensity, and direction in which fires burn.  The most important weather variables used 
to predict fire behavior are wind, temperature, and humidity. 
 
Wind increases the flammability of fuels both by removing moisture through evaporation 
and by angling the flames so that they heat the fuels in the fire's path.  The direction and 
velocity of surface winds can also control the direction and rate of the fire’s spread.  
Winds can carry embers and firebrands downwind.  These burning fuels can ignite spot 
fires that precede the primary front.  Gusty winds cause a fire to burn erratically and 
make it more difficult to contain. 
 
The winds that create the most severe fire danger, known as the "Santa Ana" or "Diablo" 
winds, typically blow from the northeast.  However, winds from the west are also likely 
to cause unacceptable damage.  Another worst-case scenario is a fire driven by a 
northwest wind that follows a northeast wind.  Because the northeast wind is normally 
associated with low humidities and high temperatures, it dries the fuels.  At the end of 
this "Santa Ana" or "Diablo" wind condition, the fog often moves quickly shoreward, 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   9

Although summertime temperatures are usually quite warm (75 to 85° F), it is common 
for the fog to roll in during the early evenings and creep over the ridge tops to the site.  
Thus, proximity to the bay often creates a pattern of hot days and cool nights.  Fog also 
sometimes keeps summertime temperatures cool in the project site.  
 
The wind normally blows from the west but the most severe fire conditions occur in 
association with strong north or northeast winds.  Under these conditions (common in the 
fall), humidities drop to 10% and temperatures rise to over 100° F.   
 
In addition, occasional episodes consisting of several still, stagnant days formed by 
stationary highs occur during summer months.  During these periods—characterized by 
continuous high temperatures and low relative humidities—fuels dry to a National Fire 
Danger Rating System rating of over 81 for the Burning Index, indicating extreme 
resistance to fire control.  This overall weather pattern creates extremely low humidities 
and enhances the possibilities of ignition and extreme fire behavior. 
 
4. Terrain on Project Site and Surroundings 
 
The main topographic feature on the project is the ridge that runs from the EBMUD 
water tank at 950± foot elevation to the southern end of Sonora Road at 700± foot 
elevation. The side slopes on both aspects are quite steep, exceeding 50 percent slope in 
most locations.  The two main valleys run north to south, which could funnel wind during 
high fire danger episodes when hot, dry winds blow from the north.  This could spread 
fire from an ignition north of the project to structures on Sonora Road.  
 
In most frequent weather patterns with winds form the west, ignitions along Rheem Blvd. 
could advance quickly up hill to block Sonora Road, aided by steep terrain and westerly 
winds.  
 
5. Predicted Fire Behavior of Project Site and Surroundings with No Mitigations  
 
Grasslands pose the greatest ignition potential as they are readily ignited during the fire 
season.  Grasslands also burn with longer flame lengths, reaching 12 to20 feet on steep 
slopes and burn with spread rates that challenge containment efforts.  However, grassy 
fuel types are among the easiest fuel types to control since they are easily extinguished 
and burn quickly with a low total heat output.  
 
Patches of shrubby fuels are not currently near any area of the planned development. 
Shrubby fuels burn with greater intensity than grasslands and are harder to extinguish.  
However, this fuel type is harder to ignite.  In fact, willows tend to maintain higher foliar 
moisture throughout the fire season and rarely burn even when a fire advances into it.  
Regardless, if dead material is allowed to accumulate, it will burn with great intensity 
after a prolonged dry, hot spell.  The biggest threat posed by these shrubby fuels is to 
provide an avenue for fire to reach oak canopies when the shrubby fuels are located 
directly beneath or contiguous to the woodlands, as is the case near Coyote Creek. 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   10

Of the fuel types present on the site, the fire behavior of oak/bay woodlands (in their 
current condition) is the most benign.  Flame lengths are predicted to be less than two 
feet, and spread rates slower than a leisurely walk.  
 
The oak woodland currently has little crowning potential because the height to live 
canopy is high (six to eight feet), and the understory fuel is sparse. Understory fuels are 
comprised mainly of oak leaf litter with grass or scrub on the margins.  North coastal 
scrub grows on the upper margins of the oak woodlands and comprises the greatest ladder 
fuel and potential for torching.  If a fire were to burn downhill with a westerly wind from 
the scrub and run into the oak woodland, torching and ember production can be expected.  
Should a fire travel to the oak crown, it is not likely to be sustained due to the lack of 
understory fuels.  The main reason why crown fires are not likely to spread in this type of 
oak woodland is that the surface fire is not expected to be intense.  Rather, flame lengths 
(predicted to be less than two feet) are not enough to ignite the live crown six to eight feet 
above.  
 
Flame lengths are often used as an indicator of the ability to suppress a wildfire and 
potential for damage to structures.  Below is a table of fire behavior with varying slope 
steepness.   
       Slope Steepness 
Grassland – FBPS #1 10% 20% 30% 40% 50%   
Rate of spread    87   95 107 123 145 
fireline intensity, Btu/ft./sec  150 162 183 212 249 
flame length, ft.         5    5    5     5    5 
 
       Slope Steepness 
North Coastal Scrub – FBPS #5 10% 20% 30% 40% 50%   
Rate of spread    31         33        36   40         45 
fireline intensity, Btu/ft./sec  393        416 454       507       576  
flame length, ft.          7           7     8           8           8 
 
       Slope Steepness 
Coast Live Oak Woodland – FBPS #8 10% 20% 30% 40% 50%   
Rate of spread    2           2          3   3           3 
fireline intensity, Btu/ft./sec    9           9  10        11        13  
flame length, ft.        1           1          1          1          1 
 
Standard Environmental Factors:  Low      
Midflame windspeed = 4 mi/hr.  
Fuel moisture 

0–1/4 in. diameter                3                 
1/4 – 1  in. diameter    4                               
1 – 3  in. diameter    5            

Live herbaceous material         70                    
Live foliage of woody plants 70 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   11

  

 
Figure 3.  Spatial distribution of the various flame lengths in the project vicinity. 

 
 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   12

6. Fire History of the Area 
 
No fires larger than 10 acres have occurred on the project site since records have been 
kept.  However, fires in the area indicate the potential for large fires to occur.  For 
example, four structures were destroyed by three separate wildfires in the community of 
Canyon between 2000 and 2005.  Another large wildfire occurred approximately 20 years 
ago near the Crestview neighborhood.  In 2004, a 6-acre fire burned near the San Leandro 
Reservoir. 
 
7. Description of Fire Hazards from CAL FIRE Very High Fire Hazard Severity 

Zone Mapping 
 
The project site is mapped as a moderate fire hazard severity zone, based on current fuels, 
population density, and topography.  Nearby areas of homes on steep slopes with 
abundant fuels are mapped as High Fire Hazard Severity, but no Very High Fire Hazard 
Severity areas are within the eastern part of Moraga. 
 

 

Figure 4. Fire hazard severity designation by CALFIRE, found on 
http://frap.cdf.ca.gov/webdata/maps/contra_costa/fhszl06_1_map.7.jpg 

 
8. Anticipated Fire Threat from and to Adjoining Properties 
 
The fire hazards on the project site are influenced both by the structures located nearby 
and the proposed new development.  
 

Project 
area 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   8

preceded by a brisk, high-speed northwest wind.  Under these conditions, the fuels would 
still be dry from the previous weather conditions.   
 
 
   

 
Figure 2. Wildland fuel types on the project site.  Yellow = grass, olive = grass/shrub, 

green = oak woodland, gray = non-burnable (trails, pavement, development). 
 
3. Local Weather Conditions 
 
The project site’s location in proximity to the coast influences its weather conditions.  It 
has the warm, dry summers and cool, moist winters characteristic of the fog belt area.  
The area averages about 18 inches of precipitation a year, primarily in the fall and winter.  
Most of the measurable rainfall generally occurs during the winter months (mid-October 
to mid-April).  Thus, the fire season (the time of highest fire danger) comprises the dry 
months of May to October.  
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   13

Threats from Adjacent Properties 

There is a significant threat of fire from the neighboring yards and structures due to 
ignition-prone construction (shake shingle roofing, and siding), as well as from un-
maintained ornamental vegetation or small pockets of wildland vegetation. 
 
The adjacent residential neighborhoods could be locations of ignitions because of the 
concentrated use, and possible unsafe behaviors, including barbecues, mechanical 
equipment use, or fireplace use without screens.  The mature neighborhoods have mixed 
construction type, with some ignitable structures that could propagate fire to the site.  The 
neighborhood to the north is upwind during a northeast Diablo wind condition; embers 
produced from this neighborhood would expect to be distributed on the Rancho Laguna 
site.  The mature neighborhood to the south is located below Rancho Laguna; fire in this 
neighborhood would tend to spread to the project site. 
 
Both the structures and un-maintained vegetation pose an ignition threat to the Project 
site from possible spread through flaming fronts, but more particularly from the embers 
they will likely produce, thereby starting fires in the surrounding area. 
 
There is also an ignition threat from the high-voltage powerline.  Most commonly 
ignitions are caused when electrical lines come in contact with vegetation causing an arc.  
However, the vegetation is well below the powerlines so ignition potential is limited.  In 
addition, all new distribution lines will be underground.  
 
Threats to Adjacent Properties 

Untreated fuels on the eastern boundary of Palos Colorados could distribute embers to the 
mature residential neighborhoods.  Additionally, the fast rate of fire spread in the 
grasslands could challenge fire containment efforts on all boundaries where steep slopes 
limit access and grass abuts neighbors.  However, mitigation measures in Section Two, 
the generally ignition-resistance construction style, and the placement of structures low 
on the slope next to Rheem Blvd, limits the threat of this Project to adjacent properties. 
 
  



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   14

- Section Two - 
FIRE HAZARD MITIGATION MEASURES 

 
A. INTRODUCTION 
 
The most direct way of affecting the potentially increased fire risk and hazard posed by 
development is to alter or manage the wildland vegetation, improve access, and improve 
water supply and distribution.  The proposed access and water supply for the Project are 
discussed in Section One of the Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan.  This section will 
address the management of fuels. 
  

B.  PRINCIPLES GUIDING VEGETATION MANAGEMENT  
 
Generally the goal of fire hazard management is to create and maintain fuel conditions in 
which fire can easily be controlled.  A specific goal of this fuel management plan is to 
create conditions where a wildfire will not be propagated in the crowns of oaks near 
Sonora Road and to ensure a wildfire will not block Fay Hill Road or Sonora Road. One 
of the most effective ways to minimize damage to structures in a wildfire is to reduce fire 
intensity.  Vegetation management is the pre-suppression means to calm fire behavior in 
order to reduce structural damage. 
 
Reducing fire spread and intensity is done via altering the volume, size-class distribution, 
spacing, arrangement, moisture, or chemical content of the fuels on the site.  Typically, 
vegetative fuel modification is done immediately around structures, by roadways, and in 
areas of potential extreme fire behavior.  The effect of fuel modification is to reduce the 
ignitability, rate of spread, and fire intensity (or heat output).  This would result in fewer, 
smaller, and less damaging fires. 
 

C. SUMMARY OF VEGATIVE FUEL MANAGEMENT ZONES 
 
There are five treatment zones in this fuel management plan: 

 The Non-combustible Zone (Zone 0) 
 The Defensible Space/Landscaping (Zone I) including the Roadside Vegetation 

Management Zone  
 The Open Space Management Zone (Zone II) 
 The Wetland Mitigation Zone (Zone III) 
 The Trailside Fuel Management Zone (Zone IV) 

 
The Non-combustible and Defensible Space/Landscaping Zones encompass the space 
nearest the structures and is designed to reduce ignitions near structures, support 
structural survival during a wildfire, and reduce the chance that an ignition will move off 
site.  The Roadside Vegetation Management Zone consists of vegetation near the roads 
and is designed to assist evacuation and emergency vehicle access and to limit roadside 
ignitions.  The standards and actions to comply with both the Defensible 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   15

Space/Landscaping Zone and the Roadside Vegetation Management Zone are the same, 
with one exception.  In the Roadside Vegetation Management Zone there must also be a 
15-foot vertical clearance and a 3-foot horizontal clearance from the roadway created by 
tree-trimming the entire length of the roadway. 
 
The Open Space Management Zone encompasses open spaces near residential lots and is 
designed to limit fire intensity and spread by means of periodic pruning of trees, and 
reduction of understory plants and ladder fuels. 
 
The Wetland Mitigation Zone is limited to the area within 100 feet of structures outside 
private lots in the Wetland Mitigation Zone.  Actions are limited to periodic removal of 
dead material to bolster fire safety to the structures that directly abut the Wetland 
Mitigation Zone.  
 
The Trailside Fuel Management Zone supports the containment of fires well away from 
structures.  Brush will be maintained at three inches in height within three feet of the trail. 
 
D.  STANDARDS FOR NON-COMBUSTIBLE ZONE (ZONE 0) 
 
The zone within 5 feet around the perimeter of a structure is called the Non-Combustible 
Zone.   
 

 This area will be planted with material that will not ignite.  Non-combustible 
landscape constructions such as trellises or fences, and completely herbaceous 
(not woody) plants which do not have dead material in it are allowed.  Wood 
trellises and fences are allowed, subject to the minimum dimensions identified in 
Section E.8, below.  Lawn, spider plant, sea pink, as well as stone paths or gravel 
walkways are suitable for this zone.  Species that produce and keep dead material 
such as ice plant or ivy may not be planted here.  This zone will be kept free of all 
dead plants and combustible materials.  

 
 Keep the ground, decking and balconies free of dead leaves, needles or other plant 

debris 
 

 Dead material that drapes over ground cover will need to be removed yearly, 
before June 15.  This includes leaves, bark, and branches. 

 

 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   16

 

Figure 5. Location of Defensible Space Fuel Management Zone 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   17

 

Figure 6. Detail of Defensible Space Fuel Management Zone 
 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   18

 
E.  STANDARDS FOR DEFENSIBLE SPACE/LANDSCAPING ZONE 

(ZONE I) 
 
The following maintenance standards are intended to direct maintenance activities by the 
Homeowner between 5 and 100 feet of any structure.  If a structure is less than 100 from a 
property line, the maintenance standards shall apply to the portions of the adjacent properties that 
are within 100 feet of the structure.  These vegetation management standards comply with the 
California State PRC 4291, the California Fire Code MOFD Exterior Hazard Control Standards 
dated 1-2014, and Ordinance 13-01. 

1. Remove all dead plants and dry vegetation to establish and maintain a defensible space. The 
following actions will provide the same level of fire safety as removing all combustible 
material. 
a. Cut grass and weeds yearly to less than 4 inches in height when 30% of the grasses have 

turned brown. Beginning May 15, inspect the grass on a weekly basis to determine the state 
of grass curing. Cut the grass within the week when 30% of the grass cover is cured, and no 
later than June 15. Re-mow if late-season rains promote grass growth after the first cutting. 
Optionally, delay cutting of native grass and wildflowers until after seed set if they do not 
constitute a means of rapidly transmitting fire to any structure. 

b. Keep the ground, roofs, gutters, decking, and balconies free of dead leaves or other plant 
debris. 

c. Clear leaves, bark, and humus under trees and shrubs (including vines and semi-woody 
species) every year. At no time should a buildup of leaves and humus exceed 1 inch in 
depth anywhere in a landscaped area. However, do not expose bare earth in over 50% of the 
site. 

d. Remove dead material that drapes over ground cover (including leaves, bark, and branches) 
annually, before June 15. 

e. From mature trees, remove all vines, loose papery bark, dead branches, and live branches 
smaller than 3 inches in diameter to a height of 8 feet above the ground. 

f. Remove all dead branches from within live ground covers, vines, shrubs (including semi-
woody species), and immature and landscape trees. 

2. Prune trees and large tree-form shrubs (e.g. oaks, bay) that are being retained to provide 
clearance of three times the height of the understory plant material, or 8 feet, whichever is 
higher. Prune limbs that are smaller than 3 inches in diameter up to 8 feet above the ground; in 
young trees, prune these branches within the lower one-third of the height of the tree. (Thus, if 
a tree is 10 feet tall, prune the lower 3 to 4 feet and keep the understory plant material to less 
than 1 foot in height. Then as it grows to 24 feet in height, it can achieve the 8 foot distance 
from the ground, and the understory plant material can reach 2.5 feet in height.) Do not disturb 
or thin the tree canopy, because these actions promote growth of more flammable vegetation 
(see Figure 7). Remove all branches within 10 feet of any chimney, flue, or stovepipe. 
Maintain 5 feet of vertical clearance between roof surfaces and overhanging portions of trees. 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   19

3. Do not locate plants that are replacing ones that die, or oaks planted as a mitigation measure, 
under trees. To avoid creating "ladder fuel situations" (in which a fire can climb from one 
vegetation layer to the next higher one), do not plant any tall shrubs, vines, semi-woody 
species, or any chaparral species under trees. Low-growing shrubs and ground covers are 
suitable landscaping under trees. 

 

 

Figure 7 - Prune branches to a height of 8 feet above the ground. In young trees, prune 
branches on the lower one-third of the height of the tree. Do not disturb or thin the tree 
canopy. This promotes growth in the understory, which is more easily ignited. 

4. Make sure that all landscaping and replacement plants are fire-resistant in nature. Prohibit 
planting of plants that are highly ignitable and burn with intensity.  See 
http://www.diablofiresafe.org/tolerance.html for appropriate plants, Appendix C for features 
that make plants fire resistant and Appendix B for prohibited plants. 

5. Manage individual plants or shrub masses to maintain horizontal spacing that will prevent fire 
from spreading between shrubs.  

6. Remove and safely dispose of all cut vegetation and hazardous refuse. 

7. Allow chipped materials to remain on the site, provided the mulch layer is no greater than 
3 inches in depth. 

8. Fences will be constructed of either noncombustible material or of timbers of at least one-inch 
nominal thickness.  Typical fencing might include "view fencing", consisting of open wire-
mesh with at least four-inch posts and stringers that have a minimum two-inch nominal 
thickness. 

9. Garden structures, such as gazebos, spas, or other outbuildings, will comply with the same 
requirements as the main structure in terms of minimum standards for ignition-resistive 
materials, timber size, and non-combustible zones 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   20

10. Barbeques, fire pits and pizza ovens must be gas-only. Barbeques and fire pits must be 
surrounded by at least 100 square feet of noncombustible materials on the ground surface and 
be located 10 feet away from all overhanging trees, and 6 feet from a ceiling.  Barbeques, fire 
pits and pizza ovens must not be left unattended when in use.  Barbeques, fire pits and pizza 
ovens should be located no farther than 15 feet from a water source (including a garden hose) 
or be equipped with a fire extinguisher.  

11. Built-in fireplaces should be either no farther than 15 feet from a water source or be equipped 
with a fire extinguisher.  All associated chimneys will be fitted with a spark arrestor.  Spark 
arrestors will be approved or listed per CBC or NFPA standards. 

 
F.  OPEN SPACE VEGETATION MANAGEMENT FOR FIRE 
HAZARD REDUCTION (ZONE II) 
 
The land anywhere beyond 100 feet from any structure to the boundary of Rancho 
Laguna will be designated Open Space Management Zone (Zone II).  The following 
standards apply to all lands in Zone II: 
 
As stated in the Open Space Management Plan2, “Fuel management on open space 
parcels “A” and “B” will most likely be accomplished through grazing operations.” Fuel 
management on Parcel “D” will be accomplished through mechanical methods. On Parcel 
“D”, the Moraga GHAD will follow the mechanical fuel management requirements of the 
2014 Moraga-Orinda Fire District Exterior Hazard Control Standards for Vegetation 
Management or updated requirements as adopted. We anticipate that if mechanical fuel 
management methods are required on Parcels “A” and “B”, it would be immediately 
adjacent to the planned residential parcels. 
 
Parcel “D” would be covered by the Standards for Vegetation Management general 
requirements and additional requirements for parcels three acres or less in size.  As 
provided in the Standards for Vegetation Management, selected tasks are to be 
maintained year around and seasonal standards are generally to be completed by June 15 
of each year. 
 
In addition, shrubs above the woodland east of structures on the eastern side of Sonora 
Road will be thinned to remove ladder fuels between the ground to the tree canopy.  
 
If shrubs grow to cover 50 percent of the slope below any road or emergency vehicle 
access easement, the shrubs will be thinned so they cover less than 20% of the area 
within 100-ft of the road or emergency vehicle access easement.  This requirement does 
not apply within the Mitigation Area shown in Figure 6, unless permitted by the Open 
Space Management Plan and the Wetland Mitigation Plan. 
 

                                                 
2 Zenter and Zenter and ENGEO, Incorporated. 2014. Rancho Laguna Open Space Management Plan.   



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   21

G.  STANDARDS FOR TRAILSIDE FUEL MANAGEMENT ZONE 

(ZONE IV) 
 

In any grassland areas adjacent to the emergency vehicle access easement and the access 
road to the detention basin south of Los Santos Court, a strip 15 feet in width on both 
sides of the trail will be mowed annual prior to June 15th.  If the grass in this strip is 
already shorter than four inches in height, no further treatment is necessary.  This 
requirement does not apply within the Mitigation Area shown in Figure 6, unless 
permitted by the Long-Term Open Space Management Plan and the Wetland Mitigation 
Plan. 

 

H.  STANDARDS FOR ROADSIDE VEGETATION MANAGEMENT  
 
The standards for Defensible Space/Landscaping (Zone I) will apply to the strip of land 
within 30 feet of the pavement edge from both sides of the roadways, including Fay Hill 
Road, Sonora Road, and Los Santos Court.  In the Roadside Vegetation Management 
Zone, there will also need to be an unobstructed vertical clearance of 15 feet along the 
entire length of the roadway.  This requirement does not apply within the Mitigation Area 
shown in Figure 6, unless permitted by the Open Space Management Plan and the 
Wetland Mitigation Plan. 
 
I.  WETLAND MITIGATION FUEL MANAGEMENT (ZONE III) 
 
Annual grasses will be cut annually once they are dry and maintained.  Dead material will 
be inspected on a periodic basis, every three years, and if necessary, treated that same year. 
The Open Space Management Plan states, “Creating, enhancing, maintaining fuel 
modification zones in the wetlands (defined as a strip of mowed land or the planting of 
vegetation possessing low combustibility for purposes of fire suppression) will be 
prohibited in the wetland areas.”  However, using hand labor to remove flashy dry annual 
grasses and accumulated dead material smaller than three inches in diameter is not 
inconsistent with the restriction noted above.   
 
J. STATEMENT REGARDING COMPLIANCE WITH FIRE SAFETY 
CODES AND REGULATIONS 
 
With the approval of this Wildfire Hazard Assessment and Plan, the Rancho Laguna project 
complies with all fire safety codes and regulations relating to exterior risk mitigation 
 
Once the fire-mitigation measures have been implemented, fire behavior in the area 
within 100 feet of any structure on the lot should exhibit less than two-foot flame lengths.  
Flame lengths of less than two feet typically do not threaten structure survival.  Also, 
because available fuels will either be kept mowed or will be compact in nature, any 
ignited fire(s) should travel at easily containable speeds. 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   22

Flame lengths produced further away than 100 feet from a structure would be slightly 
greater but crowning and torching of trees is minimized; fires are expected to quickly 
subside in intensity in the Defensible Space Zone.



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   23

- Section Three -  
IMPLEMENTATION MECHANISMS 

 
A. HOMEOWNER AND HOMEOWNER ASSOCIATION 

RESPONSIBILITIES 
 
  
The following requirements shall apply to homeowners, the Homeowner Association, and the 
GHAD: 
 

 The Rancho Laguna GHAD shall be responsible for inspecting and maintaining the Open 
Space in compliance with the Plan, and each lot owner shall be responsible for 
maintaining the individual lot in compliance with the Plan.  

  
 No owner or resident shall permit any condition to exist on his or her lot, including, 

within limitation, trash piles, or weeds, which creates a fire hazard or is in violation of 
local fire regulations. 

 
 There shall be no outdoor storage of firewood, kindling, or compost material within 30-

feet of any structure, unless the material is stored in an approved bin or enclosure. 
 

 The Homeowner Association shall be responsible for the maintenance of all Open Space 
improvements within the Development Area from the edges of the streets up to the 
property line of the Homeowner Association. 

 
 The GHAD will be responsible for maintenance of the portions of the following Fuel 

Modification Zones that are within the areas managed by the GHAD: Defensible Space 
Zone, Roadside Fuel Management Zone, Open Space Management Zone, Trailside Fuel 
Management Zone and the Wetland Mitigation Zone.  Fuel management will be 
consistent with the conservation easement where the Fuel Modifications Zones fall within 
an area covered by the conservation easement.  

 
 The Homeowner Association shall maintain all the landscaping within the common area 

as indicated on the Plan. The Homeowner Association shall also maintain the following: 
The landscaping improvements within common areas and fencing delineating the 
common areas.   

 
 Homeowners shall be responsible for maintaining their private lots, with the exception of 

the private open space areas outside the rear fencing.  The private open space areas 
outside the rear fencing will be managed by and the responsibility of the GHAD. The 
Homeowner Association and the Moraga Orinda Fire District shall have enforcement 
authority. 

 
 If a homeowner fails to maintain and/or repair his lot as provided herein in a manner 

which the Homeowner Association reasonably deems necessary to preserve the safety, 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   24

appearance and/or value of the Project, the Homeowner Association may notify the 
homeowner of the work required and request that it be done within a reasonable and 
specific period.  If the Owner fails to perform such maintenance and/or repairs within 
said period, the Board shall, subject to the notice and hearing requirements as set forth in 
the By Laws of the Homeowner Association, have the right to enter upon the lot to cause 
such maintenance and/or repair work to be performed.  Costs of any such maintenance or 
repair shall be charged to the homeowner. 

 
 Notwithstanding the foregoing, in the event of an emergency arising out of the failure of 

a homeowner to maintain and/or repair his lot, the Homeowner Association shall have the 
right, through its agents and employees, to immediately enter the Lot to abate the 
emergency and individually charge the cost thereof to the homeowner. 

  
B. DELEGATION OF FUEL MANAGEMENT AND CONSTRUCTION 

RESPONSIBILITIES 
 
The Developer will be responsible for the design and construction of all improvements of the 
project including site grading, roads, driveways, emergency access roads, fire roads, trails, 
homes, community facilities, landscape improvements, utilities and improvements in Rancho 
Laguna. 
 
The Homeowners Association will maintain the common area facilities, landscaping and other 
common area management and maintenance functions within the project area. 
 
C. PHASING OF MAINTENANCE RESPONSIBILITY AND FUEL 
MANAGEMENT  
 

• Hydrants and an all-weather road approved by the Fire Marshal will be in place before 
framing begins, or as approved by the Fire Marshal. 

 
• Initial fuel management actions will be completed before construction on the first lot begins.  

These actions include tree removal, tree pruning, and grass cutting (if construction takes 
place between June 15 and Nov. 1). 

 
• All required clearing and grass cutting will be completed before June 15th of each year.  

Mowing must begin as soon as 30% of the grass has cured.   
 
• Grass cuttings and clippings will be removed the day they are cut.  No clippings are 

permitted to remain in piles or scattered, unless so approved by the MOFD Fire Marshal. 
 
• All brush piles and tree clippings are to be removed within one week of cutting.  No brush or 

clippings are permitted to remain in piles, unless so approved by the MOFD Fire Marshal. 
 
• Annual fuel management measures include: 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   25

 — Removal of all combustible vegetation along roadways, driveways, access roads, and 
trails according to stated standards 

 — Maintenance of the emergency-access easement 

 — Maintenance of the defensible space around structures according to stated standards for 
the various fuel management zones 

 
D. MECHANISMS FOR COMPLIANCE 
 

Long-Term Financial Assurances 
All homeowners are responsible for the maintenance of the Non-Combustible and 
Defensible/Landscaping Zones inside their lot. 
 
All homeowners within Rancho Laguna will be members of the Rancho Laguna Homeowner 
Association and will pay Homeowners Association assessments to fund the Rancho Laguna 
Homeowner Association’s long-term management costs.  These assessments will provide full 
funding of the long-term management and maintenance of the Roadside Fuel Management Zone, 
and any Open Space Management Zone in the area controlled by the Homeowner Association. 
 
Long-term, the Moraga GHAD will be responsible for maintenance of the Open Space 
Management Zone, Roadside Fuel Management Zone and Trailside Fuel Management Zone and 
Wetland Mitigation Zone in the area controlled by the GHAD.  The Moraga GHAD board of 
Directors shall approve a GHAD Plan of Control for maintenance of required facilities, including 
financing.  The project shall fund the formation of the GHAD.   
 
On or before June 15th of each year, the Homeowner Association (or the Developer, prior to the 
formation of the Homeowner Association) will obtain a certification from the GHAD that the site 
has been inspected and the wildfire management requirements have been met.  The Homeowner 
Association (or the Developer, prior to the formation of the Homeowner Association) will 
forward a copy of the certification to the MOFD Fire Marshal within five business days of 
receipt. 

 
E. FREQUENCY OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE  
 
The frequency of vegetation management is linked to the vegetation type. 
 
Grass will need to be mowed and maintained when 30% of the grass cover has cured.  Should 
rains occur late in the season and produce more grass growth, the grass may need to be treated 
again. 
 
The expected frequency of treatment of shrubs is estimated at every three years.  Shrubs may 
need to be pruned of dead wood, shortened, shrub groupings minimized in size, or new shrubs 
removed under tree canopies.  Shrub removal or pruning may be done any time of year.  
Application of an herbicide to prevent re-sprouting may be more effective in the spring, but will 
follow the PCA recommendation. 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   26

Initial pruning of lower small branches from trees will be a substantial effort.  Because trees 
typically grow from the top and ends of branches, subsequent pruning needs to occur only every 
five years or so, depending on the rate of growth, and significant events which may cause dead 
wood to develop or breakage to occur.  Pruning of oaks, other trees and tree-like shrubs can be 
done at any time of the year, depending on recommendations from a professional arborist. 
 
 
 
 
  



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   27

 
APPENDIX A 

FUEL TYPE AND FIRE BEHAVIOR IN DIFFERENT FUELS 
 
The term "fuel" is used to describe any material that will burn, whether vegetative or structure 
component.  A single fire may consume shrubs, grasses, trees, woodpiles, and homes as fuels. 
 
Fire managers in virtually all US agencies (as well as in other countries where wildland fire 
hazards are significant) use fuel model systems for the various computerized fire behavior 
prediction systems (FBPS).  Within the US, information regarding fuel volumes and fire-
behavior descriptions is based upon fuel models described in How to Predict the Spread and 
Intensity of Forest and Range Fires, by Richard C. Rothermel (1983), published by the USDA 
Forest Service Intermountain Forest and Range Experiment Station, General Technical Report 
INT–143.  Fuel models relevant to the Rancho Laguna project include grasslands (each with tall 
and short grass having different models), shrub lands, and oak woodlands (with and without 
understory vegetation).  Each fuel model is given a number designation, which is interpreted by 
fire managers across the continent to mean the same thing. 
 
Fuel models describe vegetation structure in addition to typical species composition.  The most 
significant factor is the amount and distribution of smaller-diameter fuels, because these 
materials generally spread wildland fires.    
 
Another important factor is the amount of dead biomass and the ratio of live-to-dead material in 
terrain with significant brush and numerous tree stands, since dead biomass contributes fine fuel 
litter as well as carry flames more readily.  Fuel models include these considerations. 
 
This section describes conditions that are planned and conditions that would develop over time 
without fuel management.  For example, all of the existing vegetation, including the eucalyptus, 
with in the Development Areas will be removed by grading operations and thus is not discussed. 
However, shrubs can be anticipated in the grasslands on the open space hillsides and thus is 
addressed. 
 
Annual Grasslands (FBPS Fuel Model #1)   
The entire Project is currently covered with annual grasses.  Grassland also covers the hill to the 
south of the project site and extends to the east of the Project. 
 
Grass fuels do not produce much heat, but they produce a fire that travels quickly.  Therefore, 
containment is the greatest challenge posed by these fuel types.  In particular, grass can serve as 
a wick for more hazardous fuels whose ignition is apt to cause greater damage.  Grass thus 
provides an avenue for fire to travel to densely vegetated areas, allowing it to build up enough of 
a "head of steam" to burn into landscaping or other types of fuels under conditions that would 
not otherwise be fire-sustaining.   
 
Grassland fuels (both annual and perennial) are fairly uniform and homogeneous in comparison 
to other fuel types.  Generally, grasslands have a light total fuel load, consisting entirely of fine 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   28

herbaceous material that cures in the summertime.  This material responds markedly to changes 
in humidity and ignites easily in dry periods. 
 
Oak Woodland (FBPS Fuel Model #8) 
Oak woodlands do not occur on the project site, but on the adjacent lots to the west and north.  
The understory in most of the closed canopy woodland areas is relatively undeveloped, 
consisting primarily of leaf duff.    
 
Fire intensity, flame lengths, and scorch heights are usually low in the oak woodlands that do not 
have a well-developed understory.  Oak woodlands are characterized as follows in the USDA 
Forest Service Fire Behavior Prediction System: 
 
"Slow-burning ground fires (carried in the compact litter layer) with low flame heights are the 
rule, although the fire may encounter an occasional "jackpot" or heavy fuel concentration that 
can flare up.  Only under severe weather conditions involving high temperatures, low humidities, 
and high winds do the fuels pose fire hazards.  Closed canopy stands of short-needle conifers or 
hardwoods that have leafed out support fire in the compact litter layer.  This layer is mainly 
needles, leaves, and some twigs since little undergrowth is present in the stand." 
 
The resulting fire behavior is rather benign. Rates of fire spread are slow, approximately 2 feet 
per minute.  Flame lengths are predicted to be one foot.  Leisurely spread rates, combined with 
the relatively short flame lengths of the predicted fire behavior demonstrate a manageable, 
moderate fire hazard in this fuel type. 
 
Fuel conditions in the oak woodland vary with the slope, age, height, and canopy closure of the 
overstory, the depth of the litter and density of understory shrub cover.  Ground-layer and 
understory fuel loads beneath dense canopy may be minimal (well under one ton per acre), but 
horizontal fuels may be continuous and ladder fuels present where the vertical distribution of 
foliage is continuous.  The foliage of both bay and coast live oak is very flammable late in the 
fire season, should the fire reach the crowns. 
 
North Coastal Scrub (FBPS Fuel Model # 5) 
North Coastal Scrub occurs off the project site, on slopes to the south, southeast and east. 
However, as young shrubs scattered in the annual grasslands to the south of the project start to 
develop in size and cover (in approximately 10-15 years), this fuel model will become even more 
significant.  All areas of annual grass will gradually (over a span of 15-25 years) convert into this 
fuel type without some sort of disturbance (which may be in the form of gophers, grazing 
animals, or mechanical mowers).    
 
This fuel type can be characterized by the FBPS Fuel Model #5.  Total fuel loads are 
approximately 5 ton/ac, with most of the fuels occurring in the smaller diameter fuels. A 
preponderance of dead fuels can be found in the smallest size class, those under 1/4 inch in 
diameter.  The dead to live ratio of mature stands is usually quite high - an equal proportion of 
living and dead material is often found.  Additionally, live foliage on the plants comprises over 
half of the total fuel load. 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   29

During the mid-1980s, the fuel volumes, structure, and distribution of size classes of 16 scrub 
sample sites from the East Bay Regional Park District were inventoried.  Total fuel loading 
averaged 3.18 tons/acre, equally distributed between fine fuels (smaller than 1/4 inch in 
diameter), kindling (from 1/4 to 1 inch in diameter) and larger.  Typically the amount of dead 
material in the scrub is almost one-half the total volume, and sometimes exceeds 50 percent.   
 
Fire behavior is not normally explosive; however, it was this fuel type that fueled the Oakland 
Fire of 1991 on Saturday, October 19, and the morning of October 20th.  Rates of spread are 
quite fast, but flame lengths are low (usually under five feet) and heat output minimal under 
normal conditions.  Obviously, under extreme weather conditions erratic and explosive fire 
behavior can result. 
 
Landscaped Areas (No FBPS #)  
Landscaping will occur throughout the Project site.  The site is currently bare of landscaping 
plants, plans call for screening plants and establishment of landscaping for visual appeal.  
Adjacent lots to the north and east have well-established, mature landscapes; those to the west 
are newer, with young, sparse landscaping.  Because this type of vegetation is situated nearest 
structures and evacuation routes, this fuel type can be the most damaging or provide an 
additional layer of safety/protection.   
 
Domestic landscapes typically incorporate fall into a spectrum of fire hazards: 

1. Landscapes are moist, and therefore won't burn; or  
2. They contain large amounts of fuel, which will burn with great intensity; or 
3. They contain fire-resistant plants, and will burn slowly with little resistance to control, 
or 
4. They are maintained to be of low fuel volume, so provide little heat when they do burn. 

 
Problems to avoid in landscaped areas are poor maintenance, breakage in irrigation pipes, and 
unremoved dead plant material. These problems can result in a large dead-fuel component 
amounting to a large volume of fuel. 
 
See also Appendix C for a discussion of the properties of fire resistant plants. 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   30

APPENDIX B 
SPECIES LIST FOR PROHIBITED LANDSCAPING PLANTS 

 
Due to their combustible nature, these plants shall be prohibited from the project area. These 
plants will not be allowed as replacement plants.  This is a partial list; see also 
http://www.diablofiresafe.org/tolerance.html for more lists of fire resistance ratings of 
landscaping plants. 
 
Botanical Name         Common name 
Abies spp.      fir 
Acacia spp.      acacia 
Adenostoma fasciculatum    chamise 
Adenostoma sparsifolium    red shanks 
Artemsia californica     California sage 
Baccharis pilularis consanguinea   coyote brush 
Bamboo spp.      bamboo 
Cedrus spp.      cedar 
Cortaderia selloana     pampas grass 
Cupressus spp.     cypress 
Dodonaea viscosa     hopseed bush 
Erigonom fasiculatum     California buckwheat 
Eucalyptus cladocalyx    sugar gum 
Eucalyptus globulus     blue gum 
Eucalyptus viminalis     Manna gum 
Hedera canariensis     Algerian ivy 
Juniperus spp.      juniper 
Pennisetum setaceum     fountain grass 
Picea spp.      spruce 
Pinus spp.      pines 
Salvia mellifera     black sage 
Schinus spp.      California pepper tree 
 
In addition, plans should not be established which could invade the neighboring park and open 
spaces.  Refer to the Vegetation Management Almanac for the East Bay Hills (published by the 
Hills Emergency Forum, and available from the Tilden Nature Center) for a list of species which 
should not be planted because of their invasive nature.  The list includes: 
 

Blackwood acacia     ivy 
coyote bush      holly 
Pampas grass      Monterey pine 
cotoneaster      pyracantha 
Italian hawthorn     blackberry 
eucalyptus      vinca major 
broom  
mayten 
 



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   31

APPENDIX C 
SELECTION OF FIRE RESISTANT LANDSCAPING 

 
Factors that must be considered in rating the fire performance of plants include:  
 
 Total volume.  The greater the volume of plant material (potential fuel) present, the greater 

the fire hazard. 
 Moisture content.  The moisture content of plants is an important consideration; high levels 

of plant moisture can both lower fire risk and act as a heat sink if a fire occurs, reducing its 
intensity and spread. 

 Amount and distribution of dead material.  The amount of dead material in a given plant 
influences the total amount of water in the overall plant; the dead material is usually much 
drier than living tissue.  Whereas dead material rarely has a moisture content higher than 
25%, live foliage moisture content ranges from 60 to 80% for chaparral species in xeric 
conditions to a high of 200 to 400% for succulent plants or plants under irrigation.  

 Size of leaves, twigs, and branches.  Materials with large surface areas (such as needles, 
twigs, or large flat leaves) dry more rapidly under fire conditions than materials with lower 
surface ratios (such as branches and fleshy leaves).  

 Geometry and arrangement of the plant (overall spatial distribution of the biomass).  The 
shape of a plant and the way in which the biomass is distributed throughout the plant is 
important because this bulk density affects the air flow and heat transfer through the plant.  
The arrangement of material within the plant affects its fuel continuity and its tendency to 
undergo preheating and promote fire spread. 

 Plant maintenance.  The significance of proper plant and landscape maintenance cannot be 
overemphasized. Poorly maintained landscapes can easily become fire hazards, even if 
many of the plants are favorably recommended for fire performance.  

 
All of the above-mentioned plant characteristics are related to maintenance issues.  Plants 
with higher moisture content generally have a lower fire risk.  For example, the moisture 
content of a plant is absolutely influenced by regular and proper irrigation, and large 
amounts of dead material lower the plant’s overall moisture content.  To increase the plant’s 
overall moisture content, it is important to remove and properly dispose of dead material.  
In addition, regular fire-prevention maintenance should include thinning or pruning to 
reduce fuel volume and improve plant geometry.  
 
The positioning of plants relative to each other and to structures is also very important.  
Design landscapes to discourage the creation of "fuel ladders"—a continuous fuel path by 
which a fire can climb from the ground to a shrub, to a tree, and ultimately to the structure.  
Continuous removal of any potential fuel ladders needs to be part of routine landscape 
maintenance.  
 
An appropriately landscaped and maintained defensible space will reduce the fire hazard 
and the fire risk to structures.  A landscape environment that is inconsistently or improperly 
maintained does not function as defensible space, and it contributes to the fire hazard.  
Consult a nursery or landscape professional for their recommendations on plant spacing, 
pruning, aeration, fertilization, irrigation, and other cultivation practices.   



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   32

APPENDIX D 
Key Terminology 

 
defensible space – the area within the perimeter of a parcel, neighborhood or community that 
provides a key point of defense from an approaching wildfire or defense against encroaching 
wildfires or escaping structure fires   
 
fire intensity – the amount of heat released by a fire in an area in any given time period.  Fire 
intensity is usually related to the flame lengths of a fire. 
 
fuel break – an area in which flammable materials have been cleared away or thinned out to 
minimize fire spread to structures and/or natural resources 
 
fuel – anything that will burn easily, such as vegetation or small woody material 
 
topography – geographic elements on an area, such as slope steepness, aspect, existence of hills, 
canyons and rough terrain 
 
wildland – areas which are not developed or farmed 
 
wildland urban interface – a geographical area identified by the State as a “Fire Hazard 
Severity Zone” and other areas designated to be at a significant risk from wildfires 
 
  



WILDFIRE HAZARD ASSESSMENT & PLAN  
Rancho Laguna   
 

June 5, 2015                                    by Wildland Res Mgt   33

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

APPENDIX E 
Hydrant/Fire Service Requirements 

 













 

 

EXHIBIT J 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Public Trail System Plan 

April 2015 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

J 



 

 
 
 

Rancho Laguna 
Public Trail System Plan  

  
April 2015  

 
 

 

I. Introduction 

This Public Trail System Plan (Trail Plan) provides a management plan for the public trail 
system within the Rancho Laguna Open Space area. The Trail Plan is guided by the Town 
of Moraga’s requirements as set forth in the various approval documents for the Rancho 
Laguna project, as well as the requirements of the US Fish and Wildlife Service, the US 
Army Corps of Engineers, the California Department of Fish and Wildlife, the Regional 
Water Quality Control Board and the Moraga Orinda Fire District.  

The purpose of the Trail Plan is to establish trail management measures that address 
recreational impacts to wildlife and wildlife habitat, including designation of trail access, 
informational signage, homeowner education, and restrictions on pet access.  

The Moraga Geologic Hazard Abatement District (GHAD) will be responsible for 
implementing the Trail Plan in accordance with its Plan of Control. 

For additional information regarding the Rancho Laguna Open Space, refer to the Rancho 
Laguna Long-Term Open Space Management Plan (March 2015). 

II. Trails 

The public trail system is located in the Open Space as shown on the Trail Map, attached 
as Figure 1. The unsurfaced trails will be 1 to 3 feet wide or on existing fire roads within 
a 20-foot-wide Public Trail Easement.  

The primary access to the public trail system is from a trailhead on Sonora Road near the 
intersection with Fay Hill Road. Parking at the trailhead includes an informal gravel area 
adjacent to the roadway.  The parking location is shown on the Parking Map, attached as 
Figure 2. 

Secondary access to the public trail system is from two trails on the Palos Colorados site 
to the east of the Rancho Laguna site.  The Palos Colorados site is under separate 
ownership from the Rancho Laguna site, and public access to the trails on the Palos 
Colorados site is subject to terms established by the owners of the site. 

With the exception of access to the parking location shown on the Parking Map and the 
public trails shown on the Trail Map, public access is not allowed in the Open Space.  



Rancho Laguna 
Public Trail System Plan 

April 2015 
 
 

 -2-  
  

There is no direct public access to the public trail system from the Lafayette-Moraga 
Regional Trail. 

III. Restricted Activities 

In addition to the rules and regulations otherwise applicable, the following rules and 
regulations apply to the Public Trail System and the Open Space area: 

 No public access to the Open Space area outside of the parking area and the 
public trails within the Public Trail Easement. 

 Pets must be leashed and under the control of a handler at all times. 

 Pet owners and handlers must clean up any feces from their pet and dispose of it 
appropriately outside of the Open Space area. 

 The following prohibitions apply: 
o No littering 
o No bicycles 
o No horses or other saddle animals 
o No vehicles (except for emergency and maintenance vehicles) 
o No amplified noise 
o No alcoholic beverages 
o No smoking or vaping 
o No use of marijuana 
o No possession of drug paraphernalia 
o No nudity 
o No camping 
o No swimming 
o No fires 
o No fireworks 
o No firearms or dangerous weapons (except for on-duty law enforcement 

personnel) 
o No commercial activities 

 The rules and regulations applicable to the Public Trail System and the Open 
Space area may be enforced by the Moraga Police Department and the GHAD.  
The GHAD may prohibit any person who violates the rules and regulations 
applicable to the Public Trail System and the Open Space area from using or 
entering upon the Public Trail System or the Open Space area, which prohibition 
may be temporary or permanent at the GHAD’s reasonable discretion. 

 No trash cans shall be provided in the Open Space area (including at the parking 
area and the trailhead) as they can become attractive nuisances for wildlife and 
require increased human activity. 



Rancho Laguna 
Public Trail System Plan 

April 2015 
 
 

 -3-  
  

IV. Signage 

a) General Signage 

  Signs will be placed at appropriate locations, such as the primary trailhead, 
to inform the public of the location of the public trail system and highlight certain prohibited 
activities.  Signage at the trailhead shall include statements that pets must be leashed, 
that bicycles are prohibited, and that off-trail foot travel is prohibited. The Developer of 
the Rancho Laguna subdivision will be responsible for designing and placing the signs, 
in consultation with the GHAD.  The GHAD will be responsible for maintaining the signs.   

A trail kiosk will be located at the parking area to provide general and interpretive 
information for the public. 

Signs will be provided at appropriate locations to: 

 Designate trail access and certain areas where access is prohibited 

 Inform users about the sensitive nature of the native habitats and wildlife 

 Provide homeowner education and notify users of restrictions on pet access 

In addition, signage may be provided to inform the public about the limits of liability of the 
owner and manager of the Open Space and the public trail system and for other purposes 
determined by the GHAD. 

b) Interpretative/Educational Signage 

The GHAD may choose to use to educate the Rancho Laguna homeowners and the 
public about natural resources in the Open Space area. Educational signage may 
encourage stewardship and respect for the Open Space amongst visitors.  Information 
may be included about sensitive habitats on-site, habitat restoration, native plants and 
animals, and contact information for the GHAD.  

V. Fencing 

The Open Space area will be fenced at certain locations to delineate the perimeter, 
contain grazing animals, reduce vandalism, and limit unauthorized access.  A substantial 
portion of the perimeter of the Rancho Laguna site is currently fenced.  The GHAD may 
continue to maintain and/or supplement the fencing at its discretion. 

In the event that livestock grazing occurs in the Open Space area, specific fencing will be 
installed to contain the animals. At a minimum, the fencing will be designed to exclude 
livestock from drainages and springs and the eastern edge of Coyote Creek. 

VI. Figures 

 Figure 1:  Trail Map 

 Figure 2:  Parking Map 



Rancho Laguna II
Public Trail System Plan
Figure  1:  Trail Map



Rancho Laguna II
Public Trail System Plan

Figure 2: Parking Map 
February 25, 2015



 

 

 

EXHIBIT K 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Selected GHAD-Related Conditions of Approval 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

K 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 K - 1 

COA No. 29 – The seasonal wetland swale, drainage, landscape and open space easement 

adjacent to Rheem Boulevard shall be a separate parcel owned by the GHAD. However, for the 

purposes of calculating average lot size and allowable FAR for the project, Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 

10, 26, and 27 shall be considered to include the aggregate area of the private lot, and the 

adjacent parcel containing the easement (as stated in Exhibit A to these COAs and adjusted in 

accordance COA #30.c). 

 

COA No. 33 – Invasive non-native plant species known to invade wetlands and natural areas, as 

described in Table 3.55-4 of the project EIR, shall not be used in either the subdivision or 

individual lot landscaping. Under no circumstances shall the revegetation of graded or filled 

areas include any species appearing on the California Invasive Plant Council’s Invasive Plant 

Inventory (available at http://www.cal-ipc.org/ip/inventory/weedlist.php). A deed restriction to 

this effect shall be recorded on each lot prior to the recordation of the final subdivision map and 

its enforcement monitored and controlled by the HOA and GHAD. [Mitigation Measure 3.55 

#22a (for “Invasive Species Impact” Storm Drain Treatment Measures)]. 

 

COA No. 91 – The Project Sponsor shall request and the Town Council shall form or annex into, 

a Geologic Hazard Abatement District (GHAD) or other Town designated entity, to be funded in 

perpetuity by the project owners within the project through district assessments, with initial 

funding by the Project Sponsor. The GHAD shall be formed prior to recordation of the Final 

Map. [Mitigation Measure 3.10 #2 (for “Conversion of Agricultural Land” impacts)]: 

[Mitigation Measure 3.35 #7 (for “Wetlands Restoration” impacts)]. 

 

COA No. 92 – The GHAD or other entity designated by the Town shall own and manage Parcel 

“A” (approximately 120.9 acres) and Parcel “B” (approximately 39.4 acres), both of which 

shall be preserved in a Conservation Easement (or other appropriate deed restriction) as open 

space (as defined in the Open Space Management Plan) in perpetuity as enforceable by the 

Town and shall be in the GHAD described in Condition 91 regardless of ownership. The form of 

the Conservation Easement shall be approved by the Town Manager and the Town Attorney, 

prior to approval of the precise Development Plan, and the Easement shall be recorded 

concurrently with the Final Subdivision Map. The term “GHAD” as used in these Conditions of 

Approval shall refer to the entity or entities designated by the town to either own and/or manage 

Parcel A and Parcel B. The Town may choose separate entities to perform management and 

ownership functions described herein. [Mitigation Measure 3.55 #23a (for “Habitat Loss and 

Fragmentation impact”)] 

 

COA No. 93 – The GHAD shall have its own district engineer and other qualified consultants 

including a qualified ecologist/biologist. The GHAD shall be responsible for the following 

management, monitoring and maintenance tasks: (i) geotechnical stability and erosion control; 

(ii) stormwater control and water quality basins; (iii) open space grazing, fire protection and 

control, and trails; and (iv) intermittent drainage, seasonal wetlands, seeps and biological 

resources. 

 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 K - 2 

COA No. 94 – The above obligations shall include compliance with the final (i) Geotechnical 

Plan of Control, (ii) Drainage Plan, (iii) Open Space Management Plan, (iv) Public Trail System 

Plan, (v) Fire Protection Plan, (vi) Wetlands/Special Species Plan, (vii) Rheem Valley 

Revegetation Plan, and (viii) Conservation Easement (or other appropriate deed restriction), 

which are more fully described in other Conditions of Approval and the Mitigation Monitoring 

and Reporting Program. [Mitigation Measure 3.20 #5a (for Landslide Impact”)] 

 

COA No. 95 – The GHAD shall have sufficient permanent funding for the estimated costs of the 

following functions: (a) monitoring and annual reporting, (b) weeding, trail maintenance, 

erosion control and repair; grazing management and fence repair, and (c) a designated preserve 

manager and a designated biologist to periodically visit the site and report to the District, and 

(d) maintaining water quality and detention basins. Funding sources for the GHAD may include 

seed money provided by the Project Sponsor, annual contributions from homeowners, and 

income from grazing leases, and other sources as provided under GHAD law. The actions of the 

GHAD in meeting its responsibilities, including the adequacy of the permanent funding from the 

Project Sponsor and project homeowners, shall be subject to Town review, direction and control. 

All Town costs, if any shall be paid by the GHAD. Alternately, the Project Sponsor shall 

establish an endowment to provide for its maintenance and monitoring. No grading or building 

permits shall be issued by the Town until the funding sources have been agreeded upon and 

secured. [Mitigation measure 3.10 #2 (for “Conversion of Agricultural Land”)] [Mitigation 

measure 3.20 #5a (for “Landslide Impacts”)][Mitigation measure 3.55 #9b (for “Red-Legged 

Frog Impact”)][Mitigation measure 3.55 #22a (for “Invasive Plant Species Impact”)] 

 

COA No. 97 – Physical barriers shall be installed by the Project Sponsor to prevent vehicles and 

motorcycles from travelling off designated roadways to minimize future disturbance to grassland 

cover and other vegetation in the surrounding undeveloped lands and open space. The HOA and 

the GHAD shall be responsible for the maintenance and monitoring. ”)] [Mitigation measure 3.55 

#25 (for “Off-Road Vehicle Activity Impact”)] 

 

COA No. 105 – All of the storm drain system facilities including pipes, catchment, bioretention 

facilities, storm drain outfall and other structures are to be private, and will remain in the 

ownership of the HOA or GHAD. 

 

COA No. 132 – The GHAD financial operation plan shall include provisions to insure that all 

costs associated with the Operation and Maintenance, administration and reporting of the water 

quality features (including costs associated with all Town required administration inspection 

and reporting) will be addressed in perpetuity. Cost estimates for the complete financing and 

perpetual maintenance of the water quality features proposed shall be provided for the review 

and approval of the Public Works department. The estimate shall include all long term costs 

associated with these water quality features including, but not limited to, Operation and 

Maintenance, financing, inflation indexing, and replacement costs. 

 

COA No. 237 – The GHAD shall be responsible for open space management, which may include 

grazing. [Mitigation measure 3.10 #2 (for “Conversion of Agricultural Land”)] 



SummerHill Homes 2655.001.000 
Rancho Laguna, Subdivision 9330, Moraga - PLAN OF CONTROL May 20, 2015 
 Revised March 1, 2017 

 

 K - 3 

COA No. 238 – The Open Space Management Plan shall include a final Public Trail System 

Plan. The Public Trail System Plan shall include trail management measures that address 

recreational impacts to wildlife and wildlife habitat. Such measures shall include the designation 

of trail access, informative signage regarding the sensitive nature of the native habitats and 

wildlife, homeowner education, and restrictions on pet access to minimize human encroachment 

and predation by domestic pets. The GHAD shall be responsible for public trial maintenance 

and control. [Mitigation measure 3.35 #6 (for “Recreation & Trail Impact”)] [Mitigation 

measure 3.55 #23b (for “Habitat Loss and Fragmentation Impact”)] 

 

COA No. 239 (excerpt) – …All restored jurisdictional and non-jurisdictional wetlands, along 

with an appropriate upland buffer, shall be placed in a permanent Conservation Easement, or 

similar deed restriction, in favor of the Town or appropriated third party entity, preserved in 

perpetuity, and GHAD. 

 

COA No. 242 – The 2005 Wetland/Special Species Plan includes a grazing management plan 

intended to prevent over-grazing of the Conservation Easement or deed restricted lands, and a 

Fire Protection Plan. The GHAD shall pay for and administer these measures. Proper 

implementation of these measures shall be documented by the qualified biological and fire 

protection monitors for the GHAD and confirmed in reports submitted to the Town. 

 

COA No. 244 (e.) – The Fire Protection Plan shall include policies and standards to keep fire 

risk at reasonable levels in open space areas subject to the approval of the Fire District.  The 

plan shall identify vegetation mitigation and control, maintenance intervals and responsibility, 

restrictions on vehicle access, water supply and long-term risk management and other criteria as 

required by the Fire Marshal. Minimum standards for plan review are available from the Fire 

District. An annual inspection report for compliance shall be submitted to the Fire Marshal for 

approval.  Annual inspection fees shall be paid by the GHAD. [MM 3.61] 



 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT L 
 

 

Rancho Laguna Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

 

E

X

H

I

B

I

T  

 

L 
 



***DRAFT*** 
 
 
 
RECORDING REQUESTED BY AND  ) 
WHEN RECORDED MAIL TO:   ) 
      ) 
SummerHill RL LLC    ) 
3000 Executive Parkway, Suite 450  ) 
San Ramon, CA 94583   ) 
Attention: Kevin Ebrahimi    ) 
________________________________________________________________________ 
      Space Above Line for Recorder's Use Only 
 

CONSERVATION EASEMENT DEED RESTRICTION 

THIS CONSERVATION EASEMENT DEED RESTRICTION (“CEDR”) has been 
executed as of _________________, 2015, by SummerHill RL LLC, a California limited 
liability company (“Declarant”), with respect to that certain real property containing 
approximately 162.63 acres, located in the Town of Moraga, County of Contra Costa, 
State of California, more particularly described in Exhibit A attached hereto and 
incorporated herein by this reference (the “Property”). 

RECITALS 

A. Declarant is the sole owner in fee simple of the Property.  Declarant and the Moraga 
Geologic Hazard Abatement District, a political subdivision of the State of California 
(“District”), anticipate that Declarant will at a future time transfer Declarant’s interest in 
the Property to the District in accordance with the Rancho Laguna II Approval 
Documents (defined below) and subject to this CEDR. 

B. This CEDR is being executed, delivered, and recorded in the Official Records of 
Contra Costa County (“Official Records”) to satisfy certain conditions of approval 
imposed by the Town of Moraga, and certain permit conditions imposed by certain 
federal and state resource agencies (U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service (“USFWS”) and 
California Department of Fish and Wildlife (“CDFW”)) (the Town and the resource 
agencies collectively referred to herein as the “Approving Agencies”), requiring the 
permanent preservation and management of the Property for open space and habitat 
purposes as part of the Rancho Laguna II subdivision development project, as set forth in 
the following documents (collectively, the “Rancho Laguna II Approval Documents”): 

(i) Town of Moraga Planning Commission Resolution 05-2014, approving a 
General Development Plan, a Vesting Tentative Subdivision Map, a Hillside 
Development Permit and a Grading Permit for the Rancho Laguna II Project, and 

(ii) USFWS Biological Opinion dated February 18, 2015; and CDFW Streambed 
Alteration Agreement, with an Effective Date of March XX, 2105. 



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-2- 

C. This CEDR constitutes a Conservation Easement under California law, pursuant to 
California Civil Code Section 815.1 in that it imposes limitations in the form of a 
restriction or covenant, executed by the owner of the land, that is binding upon successive 
owners of such land, and that has as its purpose retaining land predominantly in its 
natural or open-space condition. 

D.  A management plan for the Property, entitled “Rancho Laguna Open Space 
Management Plan” and dated October 2014 has been developed in accordance with the 
applicable requirements of the Rancho Laguna II Approval Documents (the 
“Management Plan”).  The Management Plan is included within the Plan of Control for 
the District, adopted in accordance with sections 26500–26654 of the Public Resources 
Code.  The District will manage the Property in accordance with the requirements of this 
CEDR, the Management Plan and the Plan of Control. 

E. The Property possesses open space, wildlife and habitat values (the “Conservation 
Values”), as further described in the Management Plan.   

AGREEMENTS 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the above and mutual covenants, terms, 
conditions and Restrictions contained herein, and for other good and valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, and pursuant 
to the laws of the State of California, Declarant hereby declares that the Property, and 
every part thereof or interest therein, is now held and shall hereafter, in perpetuity 
(subject to termination only pursuant to Section 5(b) below), be held, managed, occupied, 
transferred, sold, leased, and conveyed subject to the Restrictions (collectively, the 
"Restrictions”) set forth herein. The Restrictions shall burden and run with the Property, 
and every part thereof or interest therein, and shall be binding on all persons or entities 
having or acquiring any right, title or interest in the Property, or any part thereof. The 
Restrictions are intended to be a covenant running with the land in accordance with 
California Civil Code Section 1461 et seq. and shall only be terminated in accordance 
with Section 5(b) below. 

1. Purposes. The purposes of the Restrictions are to ensure that the existing open space, 
wildlife and habitat values of the Property will be forever protected by preventing any use 
of the Property that would significantly impair or interfere with the Conservation Values 
(the “Purposes”). 

2. Prohibited Uses. Any activity on or use of the Property inconsistent with the Purposes 
of the Restrictions is prohibited. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, 
Declarant, and its personal representatives, heirs, successors, assigns, employees, agents, 
lessees, licensees and invitees are expressly prohibited from doing or permitting any of 
the following uses and activities on the Property, unless, and only to the extent that, a 
generally prohibited activity is specified as an approved management practice or 
permitted use in the Management Plan, as amended from time to time: 

(a) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, unseasonal watering; use of fertilizers, 
pesticides, biocides, herbicides or other agricultural chemicals; weed abatement 
activities; incompatible fire protection activities; and any and all other activities and uses 
which may adversely affect the Purposes of the Restrictions; 



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-3- 

(b) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, use of off-road vehicles and use of any 
other motorized vehicles; 

(c) Grazing and agricultural activity of any kind, except for those grazing and/or other 
agricultural practices and uses consistent with the Management Plan; 

(d) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, recreational activities including, but not 
limited to, hunting or fishing; 

(e) Commercial or industrial uses; 

(f) Any legal or de facto division, subdivision or partitioning of the Property or any fee 
transfer of less than the entire Property; 

(g) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, construction, reconstruction or 
placement of any building, or any other structure or improvement of any kind; 

(h) Depositing or accumulation of soil, trash, ashes, refuse, waste, bio-solids or any other 
materials; 

(i) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, planting, introduction or dispersal of 
non-native or exotic plant or animal species; 

(j) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, filling, dumping, excavating, draining, 
dredging, mining, drilling, removing or exploring for or extraction of minerals, loam, 
soil, sands, gravel, rocks or other material on or below the surface of the Property, and 
granting or authorizing any surface entry for any of these purposes; 

(k) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, altering the surface or general 
topography of the Property, including building of roads, paving or otherwise covering the 
Property with concrete, asphalt, or any other impervious material; 

(l) Removing, destroying, or cutting of native trees, shrubs or other vegetation, except as 
permitted in the Management Plan, and/or as required for fire breaks, maintenance of 
existing foot trails or roads, prevention or treatment of disease, utility line clearance, or 
control of non-native or exotic plants.; 

(m) Except as permitted in the Management Plan, manipulating, impounding or altering 
any natural water course, body of water or water circulation on the Property, and 
activities or uses detrimental to water quality, including but not limited to, degradation or 
pollution of any surface or sub-surface waters; and 

(n) Transferring or abandoning any water or air rights necessary to protect, sustain, 
maintain or restore the Conservation Values. 

3. Declarant’s Reserved Rights. Declarant reserves to itself, and to its personal 
representatives, heirs, successors, and assigns, all rights accruing from its ownership of 
the Property, including the right to engage in or to permit or invite others to engage in all 
uses of the Property that are not expressly prohibited or limited by, and are consistent 
with, the Purposes of the Restrictions and the terms and conditions of this CEDR. 



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-4- 

4. Required Notice to Future Lessees and Licensees. Any lease, license, easement, or 
other rental or use agreement subsequently entered into or made with respect to any 
portion of the Property, whether written or oral, shall contain an express provision 
informing the lessee, tenant, licensee or other contracting party of the Restrictions and 
this CEDR and shall require such lessee, tenant, licensee or other contracting party to 
comply with all such Restrictions and the terms of this CEDR throughout the term of 
such lease, license or rental or use agreement. 

5. Conveyances of Property. 

(a) If Declarant conveys the fee interest in all or any portion of the Property to a 
governmental or quasi-governmental entity (specifically including the District), then 
upon such conveyance, the party receiving title to the Property, or portion thereof, shall 
confirm in writing the continued legal effectiveness of the terms and conditions this 
CEDR following such conveyance and shall cause to be recorded in the Official Records 
such instruments as Declarant may reasonably request to effectuate such confirmation or 
continue the effectiveness of the Restrictions following such transfer. 

(b) Before Declarant conveys the fee interest in all or any portion of the Property to any 
party other than a governmental or quasi-governmental entity, Declarant shall first enter 
into, and record in the Official Records, a conservation easement that fully satisfies all 
the following requirements (the “Conservation Easement”): (i) the Conservation 
Easement will satisfy all of the requirements under California Civil Code Section 815 et 
seq. for creating a conservation easement interest thereunder; (ii) the Conservation 
Easement will be held by a nonprofit conservation organization or other entity that is 
qualified and authorized to hold a conservation easement under California Civil Code 
Section 815.3, has the financial and stewardship capacity and experience to hold 
conservation easements of this nature, and has been approved in advance by the 
Approving Agencies; (iii) the Conservation Easement will include terms and conditions 
consistent with the protection of the Conservation Values and the Purposes of the 
Restrictions; and (iv) the form of Conservation Easement shall be approved in advance of 
recordation by Approving Agencies. Effective automatically upon recordation of a 
Conservation Easement covering all or any portion of the Property, the Restrictions and 
this CEDR shall terminate with respect to the portion of the Property covered by such 
recorded Conservation Easement. 

6. Right of Inspection. The Approving Agencies, through their employees and 
representatives, shall each be entitled to enter upon the Property on an annual basis for 
the limited purpose of confirming compliance with the terms and conditions contained in 
this CEDR.  Prior to any such entry for inspection purposes, the Approving Agency 
exercising such inspection rights shall provide fourteen (14) days written notice to 
Declarant or subsequent fee title owner, and Declarant or the subsequent fee title owner 
shall have the right, through their  employees and representatives, to accompany and 
observe such inspections. If the Approving Agency conducting such annual inspection, or 
such entity’s employees or agents, prepare any reports, diagrams, charts, graphs, 
photographs, audio or visual recordings or other writings as a result of such inspections, 
copies of such CEDRs and recordings shall be provided promptly to Declarant or the 
subsequent fee title owner.  The Approving Agency conducting such inspection, or such 
entity’s employees or agents, shall agree to hold harmless Declarant or the subsequent fee 
title owner, and their officers, directors, agents, employees, invitees (each of which is an 
indemnitee) from and against any and all claims, losses, damages, demands, liabilities, 
suits, costs, expenses (including attorneys’ fees), penalties, judgments, or obligations 
whatsoever for or in connection with injury (including death) or damage to any person or 



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-5- 

the loss or damage of property to whomsoever belonging or pecuniary or monetary loss 
which Declarant or the subsequent fee title owner may sustain, incur, or suffer as a result 
of entry and activities upon the Property pursuant to the rights granted under this Section 
6 or resulting from, arising out of, or in any way related to activity conducted by or the 
omission of such inspecting entity, unless the injury or damage resulted from the sole 
negligence or the intentional and willful misconduct of the Declarant or the subsequent 
fee title owner, or their officers, directors, agents or employees. 

7. Remedies. If an Approving Agency determines there is a violation of the terms of this 
CEDR, written notice of such violation and a demand for corrective action sufficient to 
cure the violation shall be given to Declarant or the subsequent fee title owner. If 
Declarant or the subsequent fee title owner fails to cure the violation within fifteen (15) 
days after receipt of written notice and demand, or if the cure reasonably requires more 
than fifteen (15) days to complete and Declarant or the subsequent fee title owner fails to 
begin the cure within such fifteen (15) day period or fails to continue diligently to 
complete the cure, the Approving Agency providing the notice may bring an action at law 
or in equity in a court of competent jurisdiction to enforce the terms of this CEDR, to 
recover any damages to which notifying agency may be entitled for such violation or for 
any injury to the Conservation Values, to enjoin the violation, ex parte as necessary, by 
temporary or permanent injunction without the necessity of proving either actual 
damages or the inadequacy of otherwise available legal remedies, or for other equitable 
relief, including, but not limited to, the restoration of the Property to the condition in 
which it existed prior to any such violation or injury. 

If an Approving Agency determines that circumstances require immediate action to 
prevent or mitigate damage to the Conservation Values, such Approving Agency may 
pursue its remedies under this section without prior notice to Declarant or the subsequent 
fee title owner or without waiting for the period provided for cure to expire. Remedies 
described in this section shall be cumulative and shall be in addition to all remedies now 
or hereafter existing at law or in equity. 

(a) Costs of Enforcement. Should proceedings be brought to enforce or interpret any of 
the terms of this CEDR, the prevailing party in any such proceedings shall be entitled to 
recover from the non-prevailing party its costs and expenses, including reasonable 
attorneys’ and experts’ fees and costs. 

(b) Enforcement Discretion. Enforcement of the terms of this CEDR shall be at the 
respective discretion of the Approving Agencies, and any forbearance by any such party 
to exercise its rights under this CEDR in the event of any breach of any term of this 
CEDR shall not be deemed or construed to be a waiver by such entity of such term or of 
any subsequent breach of the same or any other term of this CEDR or of any of such 
entity’s rights under this CEDR.  No delay or omission by Approving Agencies in the 
exercise of any right or remedy upon any breach shall impair such right or remedy or be 
construed as a waiver.  

(c) Acts Beyond Declarant’s or Subsequent Fee Title Owner’s Control. Nothing 
contained in this CEDR shall be construed to, or shall entitle, the Approving Agencies to 
bring any action against the Declarant or subsequent fee title owner for any injury to or 
change in the Property resulting from (i) any natural cause beyond the Declarant’s or 
subsequent fee title owner’s control, including, but not limited to, fire, flood, storm, and 
earth movement, or any prudent action taken by the Declarant or subsequent fee title 
owner under emergency conditions to prevent, abate, or mitigate significant injury to the 



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-6- 

Property resulting from such causes; or (ii) acts by the Approving Agencies or any of 
their employees or agents. 

8. Public Access. Nothing contained in this CEDR shall give or grant to the public a right 
to enter upon or use the Property or any portion thereof where no such right existed in the 
public immediately prior to execution and recordation of this CEDR. 

9. Liberal Construction. It is the intention of Declarant that the Purposes of the 
Restrictions shall be carried out in perpetuity. Liberal construction is expressly required 
for purposes of effectuating this CEDR in perpetuity, notwithstanding economic hardship 
or changed conditions of any kind. 

10. Notices. Any notice, demand, request, consent, approval, or communication that 
Declarant or the Approving Agencies desires or is required to give to the others shall be 
in writing and be served personally or sent by recognized overnight courier that 
guarantees next-day delivery or by first class mail, postage fully prepaid, addressed as 
follows: 

 To Declarant: 

  SummerHill RL LLC 
  3000 Executive Parkway, Suite 450 
  San Ramon, CA 94583 
  Attn:  Kevin Ebrahimi 

  and 

  General Counsel 
  SummerHill Homes LLC 
  777 S. California Avenue 
  Palo Alto, CA 94304 

 To Town of Moraga: 

   Planning Director 
Planning Department 
329 Rheem Boulevard 
Moraga, CA 94556 

 To U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service: 

  U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service 
  Sacramento Fish and Wildlife Office 
  2800 Cottage Way, Suite W-2605 
  Sacramento, CA  95825-1846 

 To California Department of Fish and Wildlife: 

  California Department of Fish and Wildlife  
Bay Delta Region  
7329 Silverado Trail  



 Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

-7- 

Napa, California 94558  
Attn: Lake and Streambed Alteration Program – Robert Stanley  

 Notification #1600-2014-0254-R3 

or to such other address as any of the above entities shall designate by written notice to 
the others. Notice shall be deemed effective upon delivery in the case of personal 
delivery or delivery by overnight courier or, in the case of delivery by first class mail, 
five (5) days after deposit into the United States mail. 

11. Amendment. This CEDR may not be amended, modified or otherwise changed in 
any manner, except by a written amendment executed by Declarant or subsequent fee title 
owner, or Declarant’s or subsequent fee title owner’s successors in interest, and approved 
in advance by the Approving Agencies. Any such amendment shall be consistent with the 
Purposes of the Restrictions and shall not affect the perpetual duration of this CEDR. 
Any such amendment must be in writing, must refer to this CEDR by reference to its 
recordation data, must be approved by the Approving Agencies, and must be recorded in 
the Official Records. 

12. Controlling Law. The interpretation and performance of this CEDR shall be 
governed by the laws of the State of California, disregarding the conflicts of law 
principles of such state, and by applicable Federal law. 

13. Severability. If a court of competent jurisdiction voids or invalidates on its face any 
provision of this CEDR, such action shall not affect the remainder of this CEDR. If a 
court of competent jurisdiction voids or invalidates the application of any provision of 
this CEDR to a person or circumstance, such action shall not affect the application of the 
provision to other persons or circumstances. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF Declarant has executed this CEDR on the day and year first 
above written. 

SUMMERHILL RL LLC, a California limited liability company 

By: SummerHill Homes LLC, 
 a California limited liability company, its manager 
 
 By:    

 Its:    

 

EXHIBITS: 

Exhibit A -- Legal Description of the Property 



 

EXHIBIT A 

to  

Conservation Easement Deed Restriction 

 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

 

[Parcels A, B and D as shown on Subdivision Map 9330] 

 

 


	1.0 INTRODUCTION
	1.1 Property Identification, OWNERSHIP and Maintenance Responsibilities

	2.0 RANCHO LAGUNA PLAN OF CONTROL
	2.1 Geologic Hazards
	2.1.1 Slope Instability – Rancho Laguna
	2.1.2 Creek Bank Instability
	2.1.3 Seismically Induced Ground Shaking and Landsliding
	2.1.4 Swell/Settlement Related to Deep Fills
	2.1.5 Compressible Soils
	2.1.6 Expansive Soils

	2.2 Slope Stability Considerations During Mass Grading
	2.3 GHAD-Maintained Improvements and Open Space Areas
	2.3.1 Agency Notice
	2.3.2 General Landslide Mitigation

	2.4 Biotechnical Recommendations for Prevention and Mitigation of Existing or Potential Erosion Hazards
	2.5 Criteria for GHAD Responsibility
	2.5.1 Isolated or Remote Slope Instability
	2.5.2 Single Property
	2.5.3 Geologic Hazards Resulting From Negligence of Property Owner
	2.5.4 Property Not Accepted
	2.5.5 Geologic Hazard Which Requires Expenditure in Amount Exceeding the Value of the Threatened or Damaged Improvement
	2.5.6 GHAD Funding or Reimbursement for Damaged or Destroyed Structures or Site Improvements
	2.5.7 No Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Property Owners

	2.6 Priority for District-Funded Repairs
	2.7 Maintenance and Monitoring Schedule

	3.0 Glossary
	4.0 OWNERSHIP AND MANAGEMENT
	5.0 Right-of-entry



